CITY OF WHITESBORO COUNCIL MEETING
111 W. MAIN STREET, WHITESBORO, TEXAS
TUESDAY, APRIL 16, 2024 4:.00 P.M.

10.

1l

12.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND INVOCATION
ROLL CALL

CITIZEN PRESENTATION. Any citizen wishing to address the council may do so after providing a written
request to speak to the City Secretary; giving their name and address for the record. There is a three (3)
minute time limit. The Council may not address any issues, but may receive information.,

DEPARTMENT HEAD REPORTS.

RECOGNIZE LT. DOCKERY FOR HIS 16 YEARS OF SERVICE WITH THE CITY OF WHITESBORO POLICE
DEPARTMENT.

PUBLIC HEARING TO DISCUSS AND CONSIDER A RE-PLAT FOR THE PROPERTY AT 208 TROLLINGER
STREET, WHITESBORO TEXAS; LEGAL DESCRIPTION AS G-1041 RITCHEY WILLIAM A-G1041, ACRES
.3228. THE PROPERTY OWNER IS REQUESTING TO DIVIDE THE PROPERTY INTO TWO (2) LOTS.

DISCUSS, CONSIDER AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THE APPROVAL OF A RE-PLAT FOR THE
PROPERTY AT 208 TROLLINGER STREET, WHITESBORO TEXAS; LEGAL DESCRIPTION AS G-1041
RITCHEY WILLIAM A-G1041, ACRES .3228. THE PROPERTY OWNER IS REQUESTING TO DIVIDE THE
PROPERTY INTO TWO (2) LOTS.

PUBLIC HEARING TO DISCUSS AND CONSIDER A RE-PLAT AND RE-ZONE FOR THE PROPERTY AT
704 WHITE STREET, WHITESBORO TEXAS; LEGAL DESCRIPTION AS G-0491 HARTFIELD ASA A-G0491,
ACRES 1.445. THE PROPERTY OWNER IS REQUESTING TO SEPARATE THE PROPERTY INTO TWO
SEPARATE LOTS AND MAKING THE NEW LOT AN R-4 ZONING, BUT ALLOWING WHERE THE
CURRENT HOUSE SITS TO REMAIN AN R-T ZONING. THIS WILL ALLOW FOR THE NEW LOTTO
POSSIBLY BE DEVELOPED.

DISCUSS, CONSIDER AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THE APPROVAL OF A RE-PLAT AND RE-ZONE FOR
THE PROPERTY AT 704 WHITE STREET, WHITESBORO TEXAS; LEGAL DESCRIPTION AS G-0491
HARTFIELD ASA A-G04921, ACRES 1.445. THE PROPERTY OWNER IS REQUESTING TO SEPARATE THE
PROPERTY INTO TWO SEPARATE LOTS AND MAKING THE NEW LOT AN R-4 ZONING, BUT
ALLOWING WHERE THE CURRENT HOUSE SITS TO REMAIN AN R-1 ZONING. THIS WILL ALLOW FOR
THE NEW LOT TO POSSIBLY BE DEVELOPED.

DISCUSS, CONSIDER AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON AWARDING A DOWNTOWN BUILDING
IMPROVEMENT GRANT FOR LOVEJOY'S.

DISCUSS, CONSIDER AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON AMENDMENTS TO THE PROJECT #76
AGREEMENT.

DISCUSS, CONSIDER AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON ORDINANCE 1220 AMENDING THE
PRESERVATION BOARD.

DISCUSS, CONSIDER AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON AN ORDINANCE 1222 FOR THE ADOPTION OF
THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE.



16.

17,

DISCUSS, CONSIDER AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THE CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE LAND.
DISCUSS AND CONSIDER UPDATES ON THE FOLLOWING ONGOING PROJECTS.

a) Water Tower project. Possible action.

b) 12" Water Line. Possible action.

b) Texoma Street project. Possible action.

c) 4™ Street project. Possible action.

DISCUSS, CONSIDER AND POSSIBLE ACTION ON THE APPROVAL AND/OR RATIFICATION OF
EXPENDITURES EXCEEDING THE CITY ADMINISTRATOR'S AUTHORITY.

ADJOURN

The City Council reserves the right fo adjourn into executive session at any time during the course of this
meeting to discuss any of the matters listed above, as authorized by Texas Government Code Section 551.071
{Consultation with Attorney), 551.072 (Deliberation about Real Property), 551.073 {Deliberation about Gifts and
Donations), 551.074 {Personnel Matters}, 551.076 (Deliberations about Security Devises), and 551.086 (Economic

Development).

Persons with disabilifies who plan to attend this meeting and who may need assistance or inferpretation shouid
coniact the office of the City Secretary at 903-564-4000 two {2) days prior to the meeting so that appropriate
arrangements can be made.

Las personas con discapacidad que pretenden asisfir a esta reunion y que necesite avuda o inferpretacion
deben pongase en contacto con la oficina de la Secretaria de la cuidad en 903-564-4000, 2 dos dias anties de
la reunion para que so pueden hacer arreglos apropiados.



4-09-2024 10:36 AM

106 -GENERAL FUND

REVENUES

TAXES
5110
5111
5112
5113
5120
5121
5123
5130
5131
5133

CURRENT TAXES

DELINQUENT TAXES

FRANCHISE PAYMENTS

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT
GERERAL SALES TAX

PROPERTY TAX RELIEF

MIXED BEVERAGE TAX

PENALTY & INTEREST
DELINQUENT TAXES COLLECT/P&I
TAX ATTORNEY'S FEE

#++ REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS ***

LICENSE & PERMITS

5210
5220
5225
5230
5260

DOG LICENSE
OCCUPATION LICENSE
ALCCHOL PERMIT
ALARM SYSTEM PERMIT
BUILDING PERMITS

i+ REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS #+¢

CHARGES FOR SERVICES

5410
5411
5417
5420
5425
54390
5435
5440
5443
5460
5480
5493
5495

CEMETERY

CEMETERY FILING FEE
ANIMAL CONTROL/POUND FEES
SWIM POOL ADMISSIONS
SWIM LESSON FEES

POOL CORCESSICHS

ATHLETIC IRCOME

# & R REVENUE

SERVICE CHARGE FEE
GAMERODY REVENUE
LIBRARY/COUNTY SUBSIDY
PLANNING & ZONING FEES
FIRE CONTRACT-GRAYSON COUNTY

PAGE : 1
REVENUE STATEMENT

AS OF: APRIL 12TR, 2024
ANNUAL CURRENT ¥-T-D ¥ OF ¥-T-D BUDGET
BUDGET PERICD ACTUAL BUDGET ENCUHB, BALANCE
3,312,609.00 0.00Q 1,457,411.80 111.03 Q.00 144, 802.808)
19,053.93 0.00 7,023.41 36.86 0.00 12,030.52
87,524.18 0.00 75,315.35 86.05 0,00 12,298.83
570,000.00 ¢.00 398,166.66 £9.8% 0,00 171,833,34
1,244,9035.96 ¢.00 534,888.91 42,67 0.00 713,147.05
210,750.00 ¢.00 132,722,213 62,98 0.00 78,027.777
1,520.17 ¢.00 599.32 39,42 0.90 920.86
8,200.00 ¢.00 3,981.59 48 .56 4.90 4,218.41
6,970.80 ¢,00 2,083,221 30.03 4.00 4,877.59
4,276.35 .00 2,469.33 57.73 ¢.00 1,806.92
3,464,%40.39 0.00 2,610,671,91 75.35 0.060 854,268 ,48
150.00 0.00¢ 70,00 46,67 0.00 80.00
17,000.00 i1,650.00 10,76¢0,00 62.94 0.00 6,300.00
1,822.50 235.00 385,00 21.12 0.00 1,437.50
2,000.00 0.00 2,107.80 105.38 0.090 107.50)
256,793.94 608.10 61,3142.65 23,81 0.0¢ 195,651.28
277,766 ,44 2,493.70 74,405.16 26.79 6,00 203,361.,28
23,000.00 g.00 34,750.00 64,13 0.ao0 8,25C¢.00
500.00 ¢.00 75.00 15,00 0.00 425.00
500.00 20.00 295,00 59.00 0.00 205.00
z0,000.00 0.00 ¢4.00 0.00 Q.00 20,000.00
:3,500.00 285.00 350.00 2.59 3.900 13,150.00
9,500,900 0.00 ¢c.80 3.00 Q.00 9,500,040
57,850.80 745.00 43,023.00 74 .37 a.00 14,827.80
i5,500.00 140,00 12,340.50 79.62 4.00 31,159,850
0.00 0.00 46,56 G.o0 ¢.00 46.56)
5¢.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 c.00 50.0¢
2,960¢.00 0.00 2,960.00 106.00 .00 0.00
2,000.090 D.00 1,615.47 80.77 0.00 384,53
35,600.00 4,083,900 24,498,00 61.86 0.09 15,162.00
184,960.8% 5,473.00 99,953.53 54,04 0,00 85,007.27

¢+ REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS ++#



4-09-2024 10:36 AM PAGE: 2
REVENUE STATEMENT
AS OF: APRIL 12TH, 2024
106 -GENERAL FUND
REVENUES
ANNUAL CURRENT ¥-T-D % OF ¥-T-D BUDGET
BUDGET PERIOD ACTUAL BUDGET ENCUMB BALANCE
FINES & FORFIETURES
BE510 LIBRARY FINES 100,00 0.00 o.00 g.co 0.00 100.00
5570 TRAFFIC/CRIMINAL FINES 240,000.00 4,170.639 1256,497.03 52,71 0.00 113,502.97
«+¢ REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS *+** 240,100.00 4,170.63 126,427.03 52.69 0.00 113,602,997
OTHER REVENUES
5608 WEDCO/WIDNC IMPROVEMENTS c.00 0.00 24,223.00 g.00 .00 { 24,223.00)
5611 LIBRARY DONATIONS 300.0¢ 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 306.60
5613 FIRE DEPARTMENT DONATIONS 0.006 6.00 26.00 0.00 0.00 { 26.09)
5614 OAKMQOD CEMETERY DCNATIONS 140,00 0.90 100.00 100.00 o.00 0.00
5617 PROPERTY LEASES 75,193,78 0.40 35,438.17 47.13 0.00 39,755.61
5618 COURT COLLECTION FEE 13,500.00 228.30 4,921,65 36 .46 0.00 8,578,35
5625 INTEREST INCOME 285,829.51 4.00 108,159.65 37.84 0.00 177,669.86
5626 INSURANCE CLAIMS 0.00 06.00 80,092.00 0.08 0.90 { 80,092.00)
5628 FIRE RECOVERY 9,6923.00 0.00 0.00 0,0¢ D.00 9,6%3.00
5630 MISCELLANEQUS 65,000.00 15,087.55 27,138.63 41,75 0,00 37,861.37
5632 POLE CONTRACTS 18,547.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 18,547.00
5633 VERIZON POLE CONTRACTS 0.00 0.00 168 .52 0.00¢ 0.00 { 168.52)
5636 PEACE OFFLCER TRAIN.ALLOCATIO 0,00 0.00 1,194.62 a.00 .00 { 1,194.62)
5637 POST OFFICE LEASE 0.00 4,500,080 4,500.00 0.00 0,00 { 4,500.00)
5638 MUN, COURT BLDG SECURITY 5,023.75 §3.12 2,713.82 54,02 G.00 2,309.93
5632 MUN. COURT TECHNOLOGY 4,101.03 67.85 2,215.35 54,02 0.00 1,6885.68
x*t+ REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS *ir 477,288.,07 19,972 ,82 290,891,412 60,95 ¢.00 186,396 .66
TRANSFER FROM OTHER FUNDS )
5711 TRANSFER FROM UTILITY FUND 1,411,719.12 0.00 0.90 0.40 0.00 1,411,719.12
5712 TRANSFER FROM UNDESIGNATED BA 125,254.00 0.00 ©.80 0.00 0.04 125,254.00
#x* REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS *** 1,536,373.12 0,00 0.00 0.00 0.00 1,536,973.12
CTHER
*%x TOTAL, REVENUES **% 6,182,028.82 32,110.21 3,202,419.04 51.80 0.00 2,9%9,609.78

%+ END OF REPQRT ***




4-99-2024 10:36 AM PAGE: 1
FINANCIAL SUMMARY
AS OF; APRIL 12TH, 2024
106-GENERAL FUND

ANNUAL CURRENT ¥-T-D % OF ¥-T-D BUDGET
BUDGET PERIOD ACTUAL BUDGET ENCUME. BALANCE
REVENUE SUMMARY
TAXES 3,464,940.33 0.00 2,610,671.91 75.35 0.00 854,268.48
LICENSE & PERMITS 277,166.44 2,493,770 74,465.16 26.79 0.00 203,361.28
CHARGES FOR SERVICES 184,9260.80 5,473.00 99,953.53 54.04 g.60 85,007,2%
FiNES & FORFIETURES 240,100.00 4,170.69 126,497.03 52.69 6.80 113,602.97
OTHER REVENUES 477,288.07 19,972.82 290,891.4% 60.95 ¢.00 186,396.66
TRANSFER FROM OTHER FUNDS 1,536,973.12 0,00 0.00 2.90 ¢.00 1,536,973,12
*+% TOTAL REVENUES *** 6,182,028.82 32,110.21 3,202,419.04 51,80 0.00 2,979,609.78
EXPENDITURE SUMMARY
11 - ADMINISTRATICON 343,619.70 10,205.60 242,906,171 80.37 35,306.57 65,406.02
12 - CCNTRACTS 1,177,683.92 2,833.97 702,746.15 60.06 4,556.00 470,381,717
i3 - OFFICE 3i3,897.04 10,150.81 162,128.71 51.68 107.33 151,660.94
16 - COMMUNICATIONS 498,790.57 17,742.69 296,348 .45 5%.43 79.68 202,362.44
17 POLICE 950,246.43 30,575.83 520,216.11 62,28 71,643.22 358,387.10
18 - MUNICIPAL CQURT 106,3132,43 3,185.68 45,084.38 61,26 38.05 41,191.60
20 - FIRE 652,061.99% 20,822.63 1,132,688.41 249.41 493,648.863 { 974,275.05)
22 - RESCUE 45,000.00 1,395.40 25,617.43 60.48 1,590.50 17,792.07
25 - INSFECTION 120,152.32 3,197.48B 59,371.64 49.13 { 341.91) 61,122,589
30 - STREETS 676,776.38 47,275.36 396,653,533 76.44 120,667.38 159,455,07
34 - ANIMAL CONTROL 52,205.60 .00 9,565.05 18.42 53.45 42,587.19
40 -+ SUPPORT SYSTEMS 189%,446,.45 2,660.67 148,429.31 78.38% ' 0.00 41,017.14
45 - CEMETERY 2,674.6% a,00 1,069.84 40,00 2.00 1,604.83
50 - RECREATICN 377,035.08 9,077.2% 224,798.23 62.01 8,987.62 143,249.23
52 - COMPETITIVE LEAGUES 0.00 0.00 0,09 0.00 0.00 0.900
54 - PARK MAINTENANCE 314,592.15 6,323.03 144,058,98 49.09 10,380.49 160,152,468
58 - SHiIMMING POOL 152,546.32 3,700.00 18,448.16 96.30 131,499.57 2,598.59
70 - LIBRARY 234,743.27 4,696.85 104,033.5% 51.96 17,932.36 112,777.40
99~ NON DEPARTMENT ¢.00 c.00 .90 0.00 c.Cc0 .00
*+ % TOTAL EXPENDLTURES #** 6,207,785,32 172,843.,27 4,254,165.00 82.97 B96,145 .48 1,057,470.92

= == SoooszssEsEas= mmmea SEmsmmsoonmsssss 0 CoRSESNNNNERSE

#++% END OF REPORT *#*



4-09-2024 10:36 AM PAGE : 1
REVENUE STATEMENT
AS OF: APRIL 12TH, 2024
206-UTILITY FUND
REVENUES
ANNUAL CURRENT Y-T-D % OF Y-T-D BUDGET
BUDGET FERIOD ACTUAL BUDGET ENCUMB, BALANCE

TAXES

+#¥+ REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS #** 0.00C 0.06 0.00 0.00 ¢.c0 0.00

LICENSE & PERMITS

CHARGES FOR SERVICES
5409 BULK WATER SALES 500,00 Q.00 69.62 13.92 Q.08 430.38
5411 HWATER SALES 1,274,024.40 56,434.463 711,928.40 £5.88 0.00 562,096.00
5412 SEWER SALES 780,929.80 36,482.82 432,401.25 55.37 0.00 348,528.55
5413 GARBAGE 7871,838.40 41,749.97 458,841.12 58.24 0.00 328,997.28
5414 WATER MISC.REVENUE 979.2¢ .00 1,000.00 102,12 0.900 { 20.80)
5415 WATER TAP FEE 27,540,008 0.00 10,375.028 i7.67 0.00 17,165.00
5416 SEWER TAP FEE 27,480.00 0,00 11,550,00 42.03 ¢.c0 15,930.00
54318 CONTAINER DUMP/WILSON STREET 2.40 0.00 G.a0 0.00 .00 2,40
541% PENALTIES 136,672.80 1,408.84 78,356.58 57.33 0.00 58,316.22
5442 LONNECT FEES 16,806.00 585.00, 7,345,00 43,70 0,00 9,461.00
5443 SERVICE CHARGE FEE 57,254 .40 1,743.59 34,136.58 59.62 0.00 23,117.82
5444 ELECTRIC SALES 4,956,1%5.60 209,478 .55 2,908,1%75.23 58,68 0.00 2,048,020.37
5447 ELECTRIC MISC, REVENUE 8,748.00 0.60 1,117.58 81.36 .00 1,630.42
5491 CITY TAX COLLECTED 89,606.00 4,018.03 57,127.68 £3.15 0,00 32,478.32
5492 STATE TAX COLLECTED 0.08 5,854.70 64,545.37 ¢.00 0.00 { 64,549,37)

++: REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS *** 8,164,577.00 357,756.13 4,782,973.41 58.58 0.00 3,381,603.5%

FINES & FORFIETURES

OTHER REVENUES
5624 €D INTEREST/UTILITY DEPOSITS 1,500.00 &.00 1,510.40 20.14 0.00 5,989.60
5630 MISCELLANEQUS 3,288.00 .00 3,398.45 1063.36 0,090 ( 110.45)
5631 BAD DEBT RECOVERY 1,322,40 9311 186.50 i4,10 0.08 1,135.90

+++ REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS **t 12,110.40 93,311 5,095.35 42.07 0.00 7.015.05



4-09-2024 10:36 AM

206-UTILITY FUND
REVENUES

TRANSFER FROM OTHER FUNDS

¥+ REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS *+#
OTHER

*¥+% REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS #3¥+

**%  TOTAL REVENUES #*3**

PAGE : 2
REVENUE STATEMENT
AS OF: APRIL 12TH, 2024
CURRENT % OF ¥-T-D BUDGET
PERIOD BUDGET ENCUMB ., BALANCE
0.00 0.00 o.0¢ ¢.00
©.80 0.00 4.00 ¢.00
357,849.24 58.56 0.00 3,388,618.64

#%* END OF REPQRT *#%*




4-09-2024 10:36 AM

206~-UTILITY FUND

REVENUE SUMMARY

TAXES

CHARGES FOR SERVICES
OTHER REVENUES

TRANSFER FPROM OTHER FUNDS
OTHER

PAGE: 3
FIMANCIAL SUMMARY

AS OF: APRIL 12TH, 2024
ANNUAL CURRENT ¥-T-D % OF ¥Y-T-D BUDGET
BUDGET PERIOD ACTUAL BUDGET ENCUMB. BALANCE
0.00 ¢.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 4,00
B,164,5%7.0% 357,756.13 4,782,973.41 58.58 .00 3,381,603.59
12,510.40 33.11 5,0985.35 42,07 0.00¢ 7,015,05
0.00 0.00 9.00 09.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 ¢.00 0.80 0.00 0.00
4,176,687.40 357,849.24 4,788,068.76 58,56 4,00 3,3898,618.64

*k+  TOTAL REVENUES ##**

EXPENDITURE SUMMARY

90 - WATER

91 - SEWER

94 - DISTRIBUTION & COLLE
95 - CONTRACTS

96 - ELECTRIC

99- NON DEPARTMENT

$0 - NON DEPARTMENTAL

* %% TOTAL EXPENDLITURES **+

+t% END OF REPORT *++%

mEmmsooousEmEs

21,664.92 1,751,00 866,315.19 945.68 544,79 { 775,195,086}
382,784 .26 4,337.08 137,696 ,92 35.17 741.20 244,346.14
935,569.18 71,947.35 576, 945,82 63.28 15,096.26 343,527.10

5,248,468.86 { 73,190.52) 1,752,385%.60 33.39 0.00 3,496,079.26
897,844.53 5,044.21 438,883 .83 49.87 8,874.42 450,086.22
0.00 0.00 0.00 0,00 0.00 0,00

0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,556,331.75 9,689.09 3,772,231.42 50 .26 25,256.67 3,758,843.66




4-09-2024 10:36 AM PAGE: i
REVENUE STATEMENT
AS OF: APRIL 12TH, 2024

70C-ENMS
REVENUES
ANNUAL CURRENT ¥-T-D % OF ¥-T-D BUDGET
BUDGET PERIOD ACTUAL BUDGET ENCUMB. BALANCE
TAXES
LICENSE & PERMITS
CHARGES FOR SERVICES
5408 GRAYSON COUNTY SUBSIDY 455,400.00 37,167.00 264,252.00 58.03 0.00 191,148.400
5409 COLLINSVILLE SUBSIDY 54,996.00 0.00 312,430.85 58.97 .00 22,565.14
5412 SADLER SUBSIDY 24,028.00 833,33 8,202.61 34,24 .08 15,825.39%
5413 SOUTHMAYD SUBSIDY 28,432.00 Z,369.30 14,215.80 50.00 0.0 14,2:6.20
5420 MEDICARE 175,000,00 .00 76,083.09 43.48 0.00 98,916.91
5436 VA INSURANCE 0,00 0,060 56,477.82 0.00 0.00 { 56,477.82)
5441 MEDICAID 0.00 0,00 640.92 0.00 0.00 { 640.52)
5442 PRIVATE INSURANCE 300,000.00 0.00 179,223.40 59.74 9.00 120,776.60
5443 PRIVATE PAY 35,900.00 a.60 24,424 .12 69.78 0.00 10,575,88
5444 TRANSFERS 647,132.78 &.c0 0.0¢ 0.00 c.00 647,132.78
5447 1sp 1,500.00 6,00 6,300.00 84.00 0.090 1,200.00
i +++ REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS **# 1,727,488.78 40,369.63 662,250.62 38.34 .00 1,065,238.16
PINES & FORFIETURES
CTHER REVENUES
*++ REVENUE CATEGORY TOTALS #** G.00 0,00 0.00 0.00 6.0 0.00
TRANSFER FROM OTHER FUNDS
QTHER
1,065,23B.16

=+% TOTAL. REVENUES &% 1,727,488.78 40,369%.63 662,250.62

== =

*+%% END OF REPORT #¥#%




4-09-2024 10:25 AM

TC0-EMS

FINANCIAL SUMMARY

PAGE: 1

BUDGET
BALANCE

REVENUE SUMMARY

CHARGES FOR SERVICES

OTHER REVENUES

tik  TOTAL REVENUES 4++

EXPENDITURE SUMMARY

21 -~ EMS

*+% TOTAL EXPENDITURES *¥##%

*+* END OF REPORT ++¥

1,727,488.78
0,00

1,065,238.16
0.06G

1,727,488.78

1,752,188.12

mmomzsssoooos

76.87

37,916.16

1,065,238.16

405,374.52

1,752,488,12

37,9%6.16

405,374 ,92




Department Reports:

D & C
Sewer
Animal Conftrol

Streets

Electric

11



Dept 94.
7 Water leaks repaired.

6 new water taps

4 new sewer taps

Quarterly filing of TCEQ paperwork. Water loss, gallons pumped.

Cleared south union of tress inside fence

Mowed all wells & lift stations.

8 meters replaced due to screen issues.

Located and camared 2 existing sewer taps.

Wilson GST punch list nearing completion.

Fixed collapsed sewer main on Mineral st. Repaired/replaced 8' of sewer main
Cleaned up some outstanding work orders and job sites. Kept fleet cleaned & restocked with parts
Daily maintenance of system

Dept 34, picked up 4 dogs at large.. all returned to owners
Dept 91. Daily maintenance and pressing and dewatering of solids.

Dept 30 put out 36,5 tons of asphalt over last month. on D st., depot, Wainwright and Center St.
Filled multipie pot holes around town.

Mawed right of ways and allies in town.

Kept storm drains cleared during rain

Cleaned shop and organized.

Completed several outstanding work orders.

Hired a new employee,

Kelly street rebuild is underway. 2 new 4 tin horns were replaced due to rust & age

12



Council Meeting Department Update

Electric Utility Updates

1. Continually performing system maintenance based off of LCRA system study

a.

Pole Change Outs — Moving Pole line down Wilson due to storm water erosion of
poles

2. Regular work order service calls

a.
b.
C.

Customer Bill complaints

Solar meter maintenance

Trouble calls for voltage discrepancy due to fault in wire or failure of equipment
customer or utility

Installation of metering equipment at First State Bank and permanent service is
completed

3. Meter maintenance

d.

SCADA

Regular evaluation of metering points to find revenue shortages due to
deteriorating instruments. Ex. Victorian Inn had a Current Transformer failure that
created a shortfall on capturing meter data. Issue has been resolved to insure more
accurate capture of usage.

a. Objective- Visibility into Electric load dynamic. Supervisory Control of System

b. Direct communication to Relays at substation/ safer operation of relay offsite
Visibility to peak KW load based off phase/feeder/system to help analyze potential financial
implications

d. Ability to remotely manipulate relay controls during emergency situation or potential safety

risk

e. Second Phase of Project: downstream touchpoints
1. Ability to isolate faults in storm or load shedding obligations
2. Visibility of pf on a realistic scale down line.
3. Integrate Capacitor Bank upgrade with SCADA controls to improve system reliability
4, Upgrade Capacitor Banks and increase KVA rating based off of base load increases.
(LCRA System Study)

a.

Keeps electric utility in compliance with ERCOT reliability standards (97% power
factor)

5. Project Completion 2022-2024,

Schooling

Morgan Rupert

a. Level 1 Training Module for Apprentice Lineman
1. Pole Climbing/Fundamentals of Electricity / Completed Personal Protective Grounding /
Completed Rigging and Digger Bucket Truck operations
2. Will Complete final module in September

13



Jacob Villareal

a. Level 2 Training Module for Apprentice utilizing specific training Modules
1. Completed Rubber Gloving 1- Extended training on utilizing PPE in our work
environment
2. Goal is to get specific training for more tenured employees

Clint Mitcheson

a. Level 3 Training Program for Apprentice
1. Completed Module- 3Phase Transformers and Metering
2. Goal is to improve efficiency of installation and design of 3 phase transformer banks

14



Planning & Zoning Commission Minutes
March 7, 2024

The Planning & Zoning Commission met in Special Session in the Council Chambers at the City Hall,
111 W. Main St., Whiteshoro, Texas 76273. The matters discussed were as follows:

1, Callto Order: The meeting was called to order by Chairman Bertino at 6:02pm.

2. RollCali:  Present: Commissioner John Young
Commissioner Russ Wilson
Chairman David Bertino
Commissioner Cladene Belcher
Absent: Commissioner Jerry Patterson

3. Approve Minutes of the December 7, 2024 Meeting and the February 29, 2024 Meeting: Motion
was made by Russ Wilson to approve minutes of the December 7, 2024 and February 29, 2024 meetings;
seconded by Cladene Beicher. All approved. Minutes passed.

4. Discuss, Consider and Possible Action on the Approval of a Preliminary Re-Plat Change for an
11.989-Acre Property Located at Sadler Road Just to the West of Turkey Farm Road, Whitesboro, Texas.
Legal Description G-1458 Bradley B W A-G1458, Acres 11.989: .
Discussion presented by Julie Arrington regarding changes made by the State regarding a 30-day window
in which the Planning & Zoning Board has to either approve or disapprove any re-plats or zoning changes
that are brought before the board. Discussion ensued regarding the preliminary re-plat change for the
11,989- acre property jocated at Sadler Road just to the west of Turkey Farm Road, Whiteshoro, Texas.
lulie Arrington presented a training session to the Board members, Motion made by John Young to
approve the preliminary re-plat change for the 11.989- acre property located at Sadler Road just to the
west of Turkey Farm Road, Whitesboro, Texas; seconded by Russ Wilsan. All approved. Motion passed.

5. Motion to Adjourn: David Bertino made the motion to adjourn the meeting; Russ Wilson seconded

the motion. All approved.
%J

C a:rma Bertino a’ Dee Cooper, Clerk

Meeting adjourned at 6:22pm.

15



4

Y WHITESBORQ

BEHA

Agenda ltem: Discuss, consider and possible action on the approval of a re-plat for a property located
at 208 Trollinger Street., Whiteshoro, Texas; legal description as G-1041 Ritchey William A-G1041, Acres
.3228; so as to divide the property into two (2) lots.

Date: March 28, 2024

The property owner has applied for a re-plat of a property in order to divide it into two (2) separate lots.

16



William Ritchey Survey Abst. No. 1041

E
Kathleen Ann Cowlson
22 March 2013
Vol.5293 Pg.568 D.R.
E

I
X
81.15" | FS 8856'

- jhon Lk L1 v
i l = P CE U E 9
- 6043.638 Sq. Feet ¥B ) D
i 0.139 Agres ile Ck Onel .__}f,’;{,{; ] l (gali
2_-,vm_., Building g
oo 7x17" I )
O Jat Block One e g ElEQlE™S
o idng = oy 2 g 'u:
o § a 8153.843 Sq. Feet o & |
U) m £ 0.187 Acres l n: O
SR g Kenny Wiliams | 00 | Q|
O T 06 April 2005 o i b
o )| 4 g Vol, 4033 Pg.700 D.R. | & s B
- .: '.—'i' =3 m ‘E
AL S SLoQd
" |
= =T LR A L 1 02
N 8840°01" W 108.84 s S— o I X
Trollinger 3rd Addition I s
Block 2 o
Lor 4 Lor 4 s § .
David Ryan Patterson Jeffery Bruce el ux .
19 Apnil 2012 Andréa Bruce E
Vol.5186 Py.178 DR 28 September 2022
2022-32477 DR,
b Em il s - PP. i Y e -lA

17



Y% WHITESBORQ =%

TEXAS . DEVELOPMENT
SERVICES APPLICATION
OZoning o Preliminavy Plat }(ileplat 0 Plat Vacation
o Variance o Civil Plan Review o1 Minor Plat o Site Plan
o Speeific Use Permit 0 Final Plat o Amending Plat o

PROJECT INFORMATION L
Project Name or Address 208 TRt/

Brief Description for Request Le —..lp”uﬁ‘ = Dwene 104 Tt (ory

Locaflon 208 TRounG K or Parcel Tax ID#___ (e (&7
Water Services Y Whiteshoro u Two-W 1 Sewer Service WPublic a Private
Subdivision/Survey Wiceram Rureiy J4 1% BlockiAbstract # Lot/Tract # _
Current Zoning__ KL nET! Proposed Zoning Acreage _» 325~
Proposed Plat Name : Proposed # Lots __ 2

CONTACTS | “OWNER ~ APPLICANT

. o Developer o Surveyor o Engineer

Key Contact | - WYes oNo oYes oNo

Heme Yeraf/ [ivymm S |

Company !

Adess | 2361 Brar OF.
City/State/Zip & REYUS TX Jo22zb
Phone (21\0 L3 - o

Emall jlewny @ s prerum futiServe e

- e

State of Texgs ’
County of _Y&B%Q‘Q : ,

BEFORE ME, a Notary Public, on this day personal appeared 7’169 n,n\_.k W Ll aMms the
undersigned applicant, who, under oath, stated the following: "I hereby certffy that | am the owner, or

duly duthorized agent of tha owner, for the purposes of this application; that all information submifted

herein Is frue and correct. | understand.that submifting this application does not constifute approval, and
incomplete applications will result in delays and possible denlg[ ; :

Owner or Representative

SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN TO before me, this the 9 day of Qb
\\llllr”,’

20 . Nol Public Irffor the State of Texa
@!Dg % 8 @:!S} g SN, LISA BREZOVSKY

§§ *f” Notary Public, State of Texas
—,'% ‘Q\g;., Comm. Expires 11-08-2026 -

{ urf‘.fm\*‘—NMﬁfv

18




| Igguq Dg}g:?{12!2024 TAX CERTIFICATE

. Office of Bruce Stidham As: i
100 W. Houston. Sulta 11
P.O. Box 2107
Sherman, TX 75081-2107
Phone: (903)892-8297 Fax: (803)893-4973

Thls certlﬁcate lnoludes tax years up to 2023

Pt

SR L SR S

JRC - érayson Culloga RA Grnyson cuty
SWB - Whitesboro School CWB - Whiteshoro CIly
Property ID W005-1041026 Owner lD 00432432
Quick-RefID : R168987
Value Information WILLIAMS KENNY.
LandHS :  $52,303.00| 2389 BRITT DR
208 TROLLINGER ST Land NHS $0.00f ARGYLE, TX 76226-2992
WHITESBORO Imp HS : $62,687.00
G-1041 RITCHEY WILLIAM Ag Mkt s $0.00
A-G1041, ACRES .3228 Ag Use : $0.00
Tim Mkt x $0.00
Tim Use : $0.00
HS Cap Adj : $0.00
Assessed : $115,000.00

This Is to certify that after a careful check of the tax records of this office, the following delinquent taxes, penalties, interest and any known costs and expenses
as provided by Tax Code Section 33.48 are due on the described propaﬂy for ths following taxing unit(s)

Entity 0 Year | T T e (o0 Dlsootint’ T R AT e S TOTAL
GRA 2023 350.86 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
JRC 2023 167.89 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
CWB 2023 458.80 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SWB 2023 1,095.38 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Mg, Total for current bills if paid by 2/29/2024 : $0.00
y\*\“‘,‘,“‘.’i’h,,, Total due on all bllls 2/20/2024 : $0.00
§ Rt 2023 taxes pald for entity GRA $350.86
s 9- 2023 taxes pald for entity JRC $167.89

2023 taxes pald for entity CWB $458.80
2023 taxes pald for entity SWB $1,085,38

2023 Total Taxes Paid : $2,073.03
Date of Last Payment : 02/06/24

This certificate Is issued 2
on real estate only. It 2z d

does not Include minerals %b, ey

and/or personal property. U,

”4 amen- \\
7 R
KL

-y
’lllllllmlm\\\\\\\\

If applicable, the above-described property has /is receiving special appralsal based on its use, and additional rollback taxes may become due based on

the provisions of the special appralsal (Comptroller Rule 8:3040) or property omitted from the appraisal roll as described under Tax Code Section 25.21 I8
not included in this certificate.

Date of Issue : 02/12/2024
Requestor  : WILLIAMS KENNY

Receipt : SH-2024-1818202
Fee Paid : $10.00
Payer : WILLIAMS KENNY
© 2003 Tyler Technologies, Inc. Page 1of 1

19




DU ONUINYNS ONYT X020 )

CORoRN ¥ e
3 - _ e
| SRR | AT
—) ) S -
— — P i ]
1901 i Y Jouing dompeny Moo y ) RS $OCL {posng.o. mpdey;/ evaswmns)| )
noORIPPY SWENM §; Vo R s ™ ;
B 18 M meomy Aszy ."..ﬂ.lﬂ__a =
OLES-tms-—poy Ammge (A
it P00 Sme .'gtﬁ
D W N e 308 W
s

L5y X0 N woF
2y buptauns ooy xeo
mCaarn 7 e e e 3

’ - iyt s
L 450 0 s faminsd ) o) At oy o e, S AL n. 3 Pt P
i o 18 5T S Pt g e Ty [
Puv7 pup ronndug jouojsesfad fo pisog Hu._%.fiiaz;o:ﬁa!is%m o syl ) e LA e
0f spanpays of aaefion ayd sy 1041 PPN (ppjeniadn L3xg Tot Upmeys puny Jo Kyuend L ot et s ] 1 o o Fotd ¥ FEL o P s 1
#yp Joyy yalaasne ro davdosd ayy [0 uoprejsAdR; PIBLTII0 PUD 133403 BN © 1) JF Y] PUD ECLVLE GO0TE

ACoaotr purosT i do o vodn pRIoG 7 J01d 4o doit St 1oqy MIVIS Kgnisy E30p PuTieispin ML

NOLIYDLILINSD SHORTANAS e pelg Annd wanlos uf payif

bt " S
0L j mng iR Ko P anp " 5
iR - -
e ivems v APURON A0 T, T
I weinzor 3t z
W RASpT e I 2em a7 4o [xaF PO poMy fm 2pun wAAD / poaridas g apuinipeall ¥ P — el e teey
Pome kiparies g sed 7 Loepoeif g fo varrmeasye so Juiglf @ ernaren
g v pur > 31y sy & IIM«E..IJ!_._ ani 0y priipoymorery loviasy W poasanedial WOlIIIIINGD 45 Jrioa fo msif w1 Faeg LITT 3 T
gﬁgiaaaﬂsldnsi . U U g: " 0 e o) mai] S s 5 POOL AT IOEAD TROSERNHE
&y paresdds menonsad Jep T 0 e 1o P 0 Ao prFyumpim o) s 2RPT St Lk i . p— 40 LD L JD Sy Bepe 3 Berwmg ow L8
infAusdoat. TR UNNES — ey
SVXZL 40 LIVLS Fanirmy sure oyt fo rod o ewinf Qudsid sz T s O LD U 50 THI0D LD 34 A3 b b -
i P =i e oy Arivive T ST
"
iy Koy st

Bz
s1qud 39 €1 SaLpap Lqaq 20p P 131 J0 3ELS LA g 37203 ‘argrRI e, §9.£10 51001 PO IOFY

WAL 3t Symdoxd paqavap mesy oy Tupvedjen wid sy wop Aqasy wop mmjiyy, Sy 394,
SIAETTHA SEAHL ARG NEN TIV MONCE “THOSMUIHI MON
. VO &R WIS
om0 2w }—E-ﬂo...tﬁ.u I uu\!nh
%30 STC0 BUMIEOD PV ANINNIDAE A0 INIOL 4 03 3207 66 631 30 PUINp ¥ ‘R0 uonuos pias jo sory — T :
INAR ) PO YR KL, PIES JO RS YT O AL Y YPAnaaK CT wojniym g5 wasfep g gmeg AL, oar W om am s riq
TR vonmos prerje mnoa wyagmor = Tujag axe Jujqu pres ‘ees] SEMA L PP 6 SKIAS ruATPOU 5T T dDAYATT LT usnippy
oy Bmqey, AT (RIS U] 71 PURS. ¥ G 183) Oy JO SBUIp ¥ Jpang BIUIAIL 1jerJo sa Aek Jo AR -
T9E3 2 PAF g S|, PIVEJ0 38 35 3] Kk 934, WPUOED gy 37963|ur 6 AP DY GUON PRRTL " ey mp o L
) issa Yoo 3
(proapagpeydey) 9ang sTuntas oy s ...Iu._ bf.-
Jo Leps Jo qnfgare> o1 v Jupaq epe Bujqnd ppey wproasyg pasc] prre o 41 9w “oR1S amngop, b papI0ay TR TSI ‘
“T00T 1wy G1 T ouing wxhyy pravc] o1 pangy ¥) paqyasap € ¥ A ¥ 30 SR riios B Juraq anje s e )
Bingm pres ‘2 vR{ pree yo. o] Sapqoy, aIvINS (IS U3U] Y PS € 01 123] 0TO6T e ' >
Jo BT v gy bxaniff1gh, PR J0 BT MRS 31 I TR FRwDaE [D viar O maoD gp YHON FERL agciy=y
L]
§ oag Woig
P3G PN TO LLFTC-TTOL SIS TEIMRATUT “TTOT BquRdag )T PAL 2303 w2Ipiry 30 33 ey Kingap e "40.Avq T mLQTLATEDY s

0] s O} PREIN0P W oTQ ¥ o My mogyme e Finaq one Jagw pier Pen rwifp pREFJ0 S0
aEaina1 3y) ey BUTGAL AarbS KRCT Y, PUTDL € 03 P OZL IO IMMP ¥ 'PAnS DOnLA, B Jo ke 30 TR
UL 371 UK ) TERL, PIYR D Saf] IR S TR} YY) TPRSS3H OF T2I0ATIA 47 BaTP O HINOT 1SVRBILY. iy erdadl. frsp e o)

Nu=i-g =
WPz Yy} PARS BOFLA 1o LIAL P TENT 0 2 0y Supq orpe Jrod pree e Ko g
“rpioang pas P Io 407 Ja 'L6TG PmRloA B 3.. 334 "CI0Z G £ 91 *WernoD) uwy wanney o1 o 64
PRSC] ] [2qLRGP F¥ R ¥, T T\, PV o Jupaq prad
FINF ALK PR T D 18 P50 P FEpq B 81 30 e oGy i 03 Jotag T —

s 30 B C oskun
3o Lywmog i 3 FRI0IIY FAIC TG I8 E_hoﬁ.ﬁ.nnu' -!-_.s-_duﬂ!uz.us.n._.:n(ua ALY "y
Amuazg o1 (oo ¥ QRSP w 13en € 7D v Furag Joen pes Toe), 10 oW UBLED Jo LieRe]) MANMIAL
30010 *IrOT FRRRN TR Y Araig RPN SIEILAY 9 8] PR OO Jo pasd o 350 Do T 1Y

= NOLIVDITRO SHINMO & &

ONINNIDST
JO INCd

L jesns weatus g fomasy AmqELI0 O V
UOIPPY SWIBI|[IM 1401 N v
Ip o el TFUL

20



Grayson CAD Property Search

Property |D: 169967 For Year 2024
@ Map

208301
TREGO ALGE J

453278 ﬁ

CITY OF WHETESBORO .
City of Whiteshoro

Adioatt

FE R . -
WM RITCHE -

PATTERSON DAVID RYAN s JEFFERY ETUX,
W Property Details
Account
Property ID: 169967 Geographic ID: W005 1041026
Ty;pe: Real . Zoning:
Property Use; Condo:
Location
Situs Address: 208 TROLLINGER ST WHITESBORO, TX
Map 1D: WO005 Mapsce: 1
Legal Description: G-1041 RITCHEY WILLIAM A-G1041, ACRES .3228

Abstract/Subdivision: G-1 041 - RITCHEY WILLIAM A-G1041

Neighborhood: WBC1-2FOLD
Owner

Owner ID: 302962

Name: WILLIAMS KENNY
Agent:

Mailing Address: 2369 BRITT DR

ARGYLE, TX 76226-2992

21



VHITESBO

©a g ng \ 2y
b W Ly
[ S

.
-

March 5, 2024

Alice Trego
wﬂitesboré, TX. 76273
RE: Certified Mail:
Dear Property Owner:

A Property owner has made a formal application 1o the City of Whitesboro, Texas for a preliminary re-
plat at 208 Trolinger to divide into two lots.

~ According to the County Tax Records, you are the owner of property which is located within 200 feet of
the area of the requested re-plat. This is a Notice of the Public Hearing at which any interested persons
will be given an opportunity to be heard. The City Council may approve the request or may deny the -
request.

Notice is hereby given that a Public Hearing will be held by the Planning and Zoning Board on Thursday,
March 28, 2024 at the Whitesboro City Hall Council Chambers, located at 111 W. Main St. at 6:00 p.m.
There will be a final meeting with City of Whitesboro City Council on Tuesday, April 2, 2024 at
‘Whiteshoro City Hall Council Chambers, located at'111 W. Main St., at 6:00 pm.

Please circle one and return to the City of Whitesboro:

1. In Favor
2. Opposed
3. Neutral

Or, you may scan this letter and email your answer to: permits@whitesborotexas.com

Please call or come by if you need to discuss the matter at City Hall from 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m., Monday
through Friday. Should you have any questions, feel free to call the City of Whitesboro at 903-564-331.1.

Sincerely,

The City of Whitesboro

22



TEXAS

Agenda ltem: Discuss, consider and possible action on the approval of a re-plat and re-zone for a
property located at 704 White Street, Whiteshoro; legal description as G-0491 Hartfield ASA & HRS A-
G0491, Acres 1.445; allowing two (2) separate properties and allowing where current house sits to
remain R-1.

Date: March 28, 2024

The property owner has gpp]ied for a re-plat and re-zone change from R-1 to R-4, but allowing t_he parcel
that the current house sits to remain as R-1. Allowing for this change will enable the property owner to
possibly develop the other lot.

23



Y& WHITESBORQ, =4

T E x A 4 DEVELOPMENT
SERVICES APPLICATION
W Zoning o Preliminary Plat ¥ Replat 0 Plat Vacation
o Variance o Civil Plan Review o Minor Plat o Site Plan
o Specific Use Permit o Final Plat o Amending Plat o_

PROJECT INFORMATION -

Project Name or Address W‘/ M/},%{ {'fn’j/ NA/ %_ggé/ﬂ)"a TX

Brief Description fof Request Rezone J—"&Tm of Land o f‘/ and the ﬁd/ra//
Yhe house S/38 on to remem g2 R,

. Locatlon or Parcel Tax IDit_K NF 78D
Water Service? e Whitesboro Two~Way Sewer Service ijubllc . oPrivate
subdivislon/Survey Mez 4 Aol Block/Abstract#_ Y9/ Lotract#_ /A _
Current Zoning __R{ n ETJ Proposed Zoning _ /£ ¢ - Acreage _-k&we. [ YSbc
Proposed Plat Name __ Pere val Short Pat _Proposed # Lots 2
CONTACTS OWNER APPLICANT
. o Developer o Surveyor o Engineer
Key Contact |- ' XVYes oNo oYes oNo
B | ok ferial
Company _

Address Foy /e Strest
CllyiStatelZip | 1) Hechoro, Tx 5293
Phone AL53~0230- 722& .

Emll NMetrk~Corei v/ @ OuitHoock. ¢

=

State of Texas
County of _C"4yton. i
BEFORE ME, a Notary Public, on this day personal appeared \S \\Jﬁ\
undersigned applicant, who, under oath, stated the following: "t hereby certify that | am the owner, or
duly authorized agent of the owner, for the purposes of this application; that all information submiited

hereln Is frue and correct. | understand that submiiting this application doeg not constitute oval, and
incorpplefe applications will result In delays and possible denlgl.” /Z\A i

POSIIN STEPHANIE MAY

."@ Notary ID #134524139

a’?ns

g ires ) :
Hy i?)?uTtls;:nltEJ’;‘.’; res Owndlr or Representative
SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN TO before me, this the Ejb day of AL |

24



N RS
¥y uk ‘“f"-.""r

Issue Data 3!1212024 TAX CRTIICATE

P ¥
.“'.x_.",A - aat kvl Wk

SATRAYCS . Ny

100 W Houston. Sulte 11
P.O. Box 2107
Sherman, TX 76091-2107
Phone: (803)892-8297 Fax: (903)883-4973

Thla certlﬂcate includes tax yaars up to 2023

JRG G}ﬁysoncollags s Pt A SoSt AS : GRA Grnyaoncoun
|SWB - Whitesboro Sohnol CWB - Whilesbnro cny

Proparty ID W001-0491012 Owner ID 00596709

Quick-Ref ID : R168980 Value Information

PERCIVAL MARK ETUX MARY
Land HS : $125,259.00| 704 WHITE STREET
704 WHITE ST Land NHS : $0.00f WHITESBORO, TX 762734874
WHITESBORO 76273 Imp HS :  $204,216.00
|mp NHS : $0.00 Ownarshlp: 100.00%
G-0491 HARTFIELD ASA &  Ag Mkt : $0.00
HRS A-G0491, ACRES 1.445 AgUse . $0.00
Tim Mkt : $0.00
Tim Use 3 $0.00

HS Cap Ad] : $31,225.00
Assessed : $298,250.00

This Is to certify that after a careful check of the tax records of this office, the following delinquent taxes, penaltles; Interegt and any known costs and expenses
as provided by Tax Code Section 33.48 are due on the dencr[had proparly I’or the fallawlnu taxlng unlt(u)

-. Em‘wh gl “*{""mﬁvﬁ"f 7% wﬁ)&; l %-

2023 626.18 S AT R T T 000
JRC 2023 375.76 0.00 3.13 0.00 0.00 |
CWB 2023 1,014.65 0.00 846 0.00 0.00
SWB 2023 1,347.81 0.00 11.23 0.00 0.00
Total for current bills if pald by 3/31/2024 : $0.00
\\\\\\\llilll"l[”” Total due on all bills 3/31/2024 : $0.00
S c0Leg, 7 %, 2023 taxes paid for entity GRA $630.39
§’\ "‘mq.’/(,, 2023 taxes pald for entity JRC $378.89
7 "‘-._ Z 2023 taxes paid for entity CWB $1,023.11
i %‘ = 2023 taxes paid for entity SWB $1,369.04
THESAECate ';‘r:l’: ueg | iNE 2023 Total Taxes Pald : $3,391.43
: 2 N e :
doai P oL nelidarrarals ,,% e = § Date of Last Payment : 03/08/24
and/or personal property. U000 e

/””llmmlm\\\\\\

If applicable, the above-described property has/is recelving special appraisal based on Its use, and additional rollback taxes may become due based on

the provisions of the special appralsal (Comptroller Rule 9.3040) or property omitted from the appralsal roll es described under Tax Code Section 25.21 Is
not Included In this certificate.

Date of Issue : 03/12/2024
Requestor : PERCIVAL MARK ETUX MARY

(S

Receipt : SH-2024-1822473
Fee Paid : $10.00
Payer : PERCIVAL MARK ETUX MARY

© 2003 Tyler Technologies, Inc. Page 1 of 1

25



Grayson CAD Property Search
Property ID: 168980 For Year 2024

@ Map
158995 165560
! ; . 188268
CHISUM MARTHA COLLINS TONY ETUX L AWANNA FAYETTE DONNE CLAIR ET
765986 ﬁ
"HALE THOMAS W
I SR 166080
City offh 't* PERCIVALMARK ETUX MARY
1GROYT o
FEISKERTRILEY
168981
154958 _ ALLEN TRACY
FLETCHER DARDEN D
B Property Details

Account I
Property ID: 168980 Geographic 1D: W001 0491012
Type: Real Zoning: :
Property Use: Condo:
Location
Situs Address: 704 WHITE ST WHITESBORO, TX 76273
iap 1D: W001 Mapsco: 1
Legal Description: G-0491 HARTFIELD ASA & HRS A-G0481, ACRES 1.445

Abstract/Subdivision: G-0491 - HARTFIELD ASA & HRS A-G0481

Neighborhood: WBC3FOLD

Owner

Owner ID: 476954

Name: PERCIVAL MARK ETUX MARY
Agent:

Mailing Address: 704 WHITE STREET

WHITESBORO, TX 76273-1330

26



LA Yas prourmp
Frpl Deeeedpiied
rwt i 4 2y g g patal

Pe vt ey !"lﬂghmw AR
"“ﬂnm o eir LAt
Akt e v 4 R
ol v b iy s s ey
e s uta £171 gt rmsh
peemtiicy

m«gﬁﬁxkiil.dmh-—‘woumhl-«#mh

.......ruw....m;.‘{"‘.glb‘ﬂm-..h..«..m
Bz PUrED Sihey M“""a’h‘."u.._mcw;-.,.-nmm 3 M Peiis b 3o
TArrad Nk 201 ik § et e

Pacn S R it kb sy 1 i o R LAY TR
P ey At i ot e

B e B U T e WA, MUK PERESL 107 LLATY BEACRIL Oty wod Diartonct if i Pralink
el ord e b e R T e s wdhens
L= ekttt ety > e el e e e b T e

d\s:n--\urw 1AL o v a4 et pratpsnsbenat b m"'u’.m“"‘e.,s“"., T ha it e

i AT E ottt B Py P of H Al RSB T e
i sy [oEamy
Daxy Lo CPArGe FaN, o A A L AT T

n et ak i daa res sl K M BT L2t ca e sy o Por bprd ot ot

Th ey e e T e o e P o

prerikiye T b

I At R e TR AT S priimepiras-Linainymi g

Thdich B i L F1ITR g o s e o L) nnw .

L I‘“Im‘ hed et ity VOTVIAIMYHANT B0 el
peyhy ool VAT 1S bR v et T B A

MVM‘JBMM FRIRLIE) 5 Y KL P2 5oty Femptl, i Pt

Pt oy sy
it ML NI Eitt, by 5 bt g 4 g 1 mad it ‘ L
3 et e T e P o Epiiog i ety cuern
Tid it vhnt
o
AR AL MO THELE PRIV ]
x| diad PuAesemsstLard Bk o
Ve S A I
- e HEAT e v e Frae a0 bt 2 ey ans
T e Bk riems o £ Gl o b, mn"..um.w ;u:Ju..umnm-.--un-
1 s
T GV LD MY LS A2 FLLL G TN Wi .
<=y o saa1
Erburt herutnd
frorpaiiaging o] Al
g i

AZZTHED RER PR £) Fln 710

u Bred [T
:‘ﬁ:__::.;::._. SRR .
u x
. e FRrelininney 3¥at of
. e e — Percival Additlon
FESERE E%_E;m & abk{tios 1o
AT =5 the @ity of ¥)itesboro
Grapgon Countp, Cexad
! FWeing L4458 meres out of
Coptep b Sudicphiy S, ey Hex Tarltiels Surbep,
. s Morlidrllapet i o A £ ava e Ebslvnct S0, 49t
X nrien, Rk Gz et

27




R m— e
v et AL IV
08002012 #0E SED it v woy-Hids
A _ . 0 = g Tv0s 1910-096-095 ¥E¢
9L0G . SEN3TD, ‘LRI
1Z0Z/BLIE AIAUNS H0 AlYa
62¢56L0% ON Ll og ~  oF 0 PumdIgInes q
0229 "ON JofeAINg puET !
reuojssaald petaisibox
Res
A L]
|
-anoqeulalaly pagussap Ajebe) Auedoid syj jo uopejUssalda. ajeInooe pue Jo3.L00
‘snuy e SIypmessy jeid oyl 1Byl pue ‘uialal peqgliossp Aebep Auadoid ay; jo punolb eyt Uo speLu
sem Aeruns e jey; Apes Aqgaisy op YodeAing pueT [euoissajold pauaysibay Aeidog o uyor [ :
: 1L09ud0 Faey g
Hﬂn—.ﬁ&unumm—mm .—..mmM_.Hm. ﬁ@uﬂﬁ@ NN@ 4 LI'9YL0 95 "Sd '£95€ TJOA nﬁ.ﬁ@wm.,nwmm
LIWONOT #52'9d "6¥8Y TI0A NITIV ¥ 330 NITIV Y3
I NHOHAY Y AT70d NITIY N NOd 1 NITIV YN
TS ) NHOHIY SIAVYL 3NO LOVAL 1 OML LoV
LWHIEY avoLen ov 660 JCTEX ]
FONI SINFINIVHS LooWdY 10U
i oM SrEa LA K]
TR avz rom JL8IA NYIVINVT
B g | o B Ov.Spi X.08 | NIHOB AV VIONYETY i I
SN AHVONNOE 106°6 i IVIED I
HALIN UALYM anno4 goy
B (0729 §7d¥) & ..mo_NOo%.mn_mom TS .
Tiod ¥amod gl a0y 01968 .
ad 438 T92LS 2/ 6 1S\ P 188 W
LNONVATD HIMIS BO TFALS 2l 00°08 ° && ,05,82.98 &F . 1w<Gible
918 HALYM ]
QUIBIE 5
X t
(o]
-
&
a
& I
k] :
LOOYLO = !
61 "Dd 2508 “I0A i i
AZBSNE S JINVT X . .
A3ESE STTIVHO 1 B 9P 1 b4
16% "0FE PRSI
—-
8 d3qInes QEBIEGE P51
ﬁ?ON H
|
g L
(bz28 S7dY) o
.%MMWM“ [ D 10T, 2548 & .
: e AN R
|
% ofe .
LOOUHO
T s — 026 *Sd 'C9LE TIOA
r— LOOYLC
£6262-LL0Z "ON INSNN2OQ mz%:%.wnmzxﬁoﬁﬁ
EVERE] oV pz'0
ILLZAvd JINNOG 1
OV695} 4 |
N
ﬁ (z0zZp) INOZ TVHLNID HLHON
WILSAS TLYNIGHOOD SNYTd FLVLS SYXEL
£8 QYN HLYON i
~ SONIMVYIHE H0 SISYE ~ .
%= I————E S—



I ke LS W LIS

DT VL AL T ! NMW%M%Wh _. L
I
066 .
A :mc.g&wnﬂmu w 7oL Qo
RIS
aNEcH aay 0L 868
i TATLS. T AN EGH L
L0028 AL OSEZ.B8 N oo :.:........Vﬂl.l........l-l-l-mw..wlmml. S e
o AN SN & T T T T e e e e e e — e ove
A S e v — - 48 TrEeme—
=" AR oniETRg 5 ~i- g .._m.%
: .
i - e e A BN ONIGUOE S M
) = iwl.. et T
- h o & =0 o w! - e
: b bl TNRE F " T T T
s b JRl
mﬁ m G — !
2 i . 1
“m 14°Dg GLesy ..s 1 :
2 SIS 92071 s 3 5
i IR £ iz 5
- SN = [
: I L) 2!
.m f 1= (0] 5.-
m mu mﬁ 3
I ¥ '
& p ]
m A
.I.l.l.l:...l.l-l.I..I,.i.i.l.!.!-l.t.nm.zb.mw._él.m.,ml. 1 m
— e ¥ — e e L T !IQI!I-.II!L - - -
& ize 3 02.16.08 5 - — —o—
[ a 3 -,
" Sl..mwm Mwmm WLBYL FwlLB88 S
13348 T
H
4 A e
062 ©d 298 10N
SNITIO0 YNNVAY'T
SNFTIOD ANOL
OVELIED
2oaNE0
EEL0Z-2LOZ "ON INTWN0OT
SLLTAYS IVY
FHITFAYE SINNOG

oy Baa"L

A% TOZE TIRITE0ER




§ 153.062 EASEMENTS AND DEDICATIONS.

(A) Utility easements. Ten feet wide utility easements shall be provided on the rear lot line of each

lot. Easements shall be provided at all other locations necessary for the construction and maintenance
of utilities. '

(B) Drainage easements. Drainage easements shall be provided for the construction and

maintenance of drainage systems of such size and location necessary as determined by the drainage
plans.

\

(C) Fire lanes. Where adequate access for fire fighting is not otherwise provided, easements for fire
lanes shall be required. Fire lane easements shall be paved to a minimum of 20 feet in width and shall
be marked as such on the ground.

(D) Parks and open space. There shall be no dediéation of parks, open space, or other public
access areas except as authorized by the city. |

(E) Schools. There shall be no dedication or reservation of land for school purposes except as
authorized by the City in consultation with the Whitesboro ISD.

(F) Public facilities. There shall be no dedication or reservation of land for public buil'dirigs or
facilities except as authorized by the city.

(Ord. 933, passed 8-9-05) Penalty, see § 153.999

30



Maich 12, 2624

Red's Electrical Service
H1LN. Unlon S,
Whitesharo, TX, 76273

RE: Certified Mail: 9589 0710 5270 1432 0158 50 and regular mail
Dear Property Ownar:

A Property owner has made a farmal application to the City of Whitesboro; Texas for a prelfminary re-
plat at 704 White Strest to divide into two lots.

According to the County Tax Recards, you are.the owner of property which is located within 200 fest of
the area of the requestad re-plat. This is a Notice of the Publie Hearing at which any interaested persons
will be glven an oppertunity to be heard. The Gity Countil may approve the request or may deny the
request. | :

Notice is heraby given that-a Public Hearing will be held by the Plapning.and Zohing Board on Thursday,
March 28; 2024 st thie Whitesboro City Hall Couneil Eharnbers, logatet at 111, W. Maln St. 5t 6:00 p.mi.
Thete will be a final meeting with City of Whitashorq City Council on Tu_esday, Aprif 2, 2024 a1
Whiteshorg City Hall Council Chambers, located at 111 W, Main St;, #-6:00 pifi.

Plédsg titcle dhe ahd return to the City of Whitesboro:

1, In Favoy
Z. Opposed
3, Neutral

Or, you may scan.this lettei and emall your answer to: parmits@whiteshorotexas.con

Please call or come by if you need to discuss the matter at City Hall from 8:00 a.m to 5:00 p.m., Monday
through Fiiday. Should you have any questions, feal frea ta call the City of Whitesboro af 903-564-334.1.

Sincerely,

The City of Whiteshoro

31



] %.‘J
>/'.i'*= WHIIE\SPOQ P.0. Box 340/111 W. Main St
‘Whitesboro, TX 76273

903-564-4000

Applicant: Lau rie /LA// :‘arc/

Business: LOVC'\‘D\/S onNn Mﬂ:‘n SD{
U

Project: ANew Ffﬂcac/e

Date Submitted: j‘/-‘ /0'.:94

Contact Number: ?03‘ 43(0-' 3/82

Eligible Application
Located within the designated district of Whitesboro
Will this project preserve or enhance the historic character

Does this project comply with all local, state, and federal regulations

Is the project proposal a clear and viable project

Is the Application complete

.{2\1

>/€S Did the applicant apply for a Fee Waiver
Y-l -2’)/ Date of the Council review

Notes:

This application has been reviewed by the City Secretary and deemed eligible for council review on the

above date. Applicant has been duly notified of the date for the council review.

Teresa Nifio, City Secretary Date

32



¥ WHITESBORQ

TG
Downtown Building Improvement Grant Application

The information requested below will be used to process your application under the terms and conditions of
the City of Whitesboro’s Downtown Building Improvement Grant. All grant applications must include pictures
of the current building, designs or renderings of the finished product, if available.

I Applicant Information

1, Applicant(s) name: LOU“SO)\() on Mdumg'
Mailing address:. & PO. Bo}t b0
City: WK‘)Lengﬂ) State: [ Zip: 1273

2. Applicant’s daytime telephone number: Q_O‘%«f £3,,-3\H2—
E-mail address:___|oye \0U2 97\ ) vileom

3. Status of applicant (please check one)

Property owner with vacant facility

Property owner with tenant business

Property owner/operator of existing business on property

Property deed, lease, or other document evidencing applicant’s status

BN

5. Length of ownership: “34‘%(1’5 _
Date purchased: 19192 - \(\@Mﬁ(u('.)/ amed 7o's

L. Property Information
% Address of property to be improved: 2@ E Mm&_‘_‘_m@(gg_byﬁlijl_
2. Legal description of subject property:

Gi-1042 Kr\’dneq Willtam & A4\ X 209, Undivided

3. Grayson County Tax Assessor Parcel Number(s):

1"18000)
4. Year built: lﬁfiﬂ 'ﬁ Square footage: (27008 4;6@

33



6. What are the current types of businesses or other uses occupying the building?

Rﬂ%fu(b e P—M‘(’du.ha,«\&'

7. Name and phone number of tenant(s), if applicable: WS- 1445002 tadd

) - 392 G02—L 51 -101>
(Attach additional names/numbers, if needed)

8. Use of building after construction: _ @44

st

9, Number of parking spéces provided: Proposed: Total:

10.  Current zoning: Cﬁ’nvwwm aAl

11.  Is azoning amendment required? Yes__ No_/

1L Project Description

1. Description of Proposed improvements. Please provide a detailed description of your
proposed improvements. Attach a copy of your arch_itectural or design plans if possible.

Description: i@/_[gl ‘ﬁ(aéj o revcteln k@sﬁaﬂ‘(gﬂ d@%\,

Q/Designs Attached [ “Before” Picture(s) Attached
2. How many jobs will be retained once the project is completed?
Z Full-time positions 270~ Ppart-time positions
3, - How many new positions will result from this project?
Full-time positions Part-time positions

iv. Work Estimates

34



Vi

Vil

Please attach independent contractor estimates for the proposed improvements, Eligible costs shall be
the cost of materials, equipment, and contracted labor to complete eligible improvements.

1. Name/company and phone number of preferred contractor:
Chcts Bopen Lonstruchion. - 719 - 423059
wauhis e \giAd -
Amount: ~Z0K ;

2. Name/company and phone number of second contractor (if obtained):

Brondt pew Qoastauchig - 2\4 -2\0 - 7440

Amount: 2530 It estimated

3. Additional estimates/comments: (Please attach additional quotes, as required)

4, Total estimated costs of your improvements: 15-2ol

4. Estimated completion date for your improvements? _ W f“l‘frlu}u 1.8 léta/\/

Fee Walver Request

1. Are you also requesting a fee walver consideration for this project? \}éﬁ

Agreement of Applicant and Properiv Owner

I/We, L@\h‘ﬂOM BN MQAW\ , of. the

City of Whitesbb’ro,&:ounty of Grayson, State of Texas, declare under penalty of perjury that the
information contained in this application is true and correct and that the information contained in the
documents that accompany this application is true, correct, and completa. I/We certify and warrant
that the proposed waork described in this Application meets the eligibility requirements of the City of
Whitesboro Downtown Building Improvement Grant Program. In exchange for the City of Whitesboro’s
consideration of this application, I/We hereby agree to the following: ‘

I/We hereby authorize City of Whitesboro employees and agents to perform inspections of my/our
property if granted funds under the City of Whitesboro Downtown Building Improvement Grant
Program, both before and during the work for which funds are granted under this Program and after
completion of the work to ensure compliance with the terms and conditions of the Program and all
other applicable ordinances and other laws.

I/We acknowledge that any work carried out prior to written confirmation of grant approval may not
be eligible for reimbursement.

I/We acknowledge receiving, understanding, and accepting the terms and conditions of the City of
Whitesboro Downtown Building Improvement Grant Program, and agree to fully comply with the same
along with all other applicable ordinances and other laws, all of which are incorporated herein by
reference, if granted funds under the Program. | agree that the City of Whitesboro is entitled to the
immediate return or relmbursement of any and all funds paid to the Applicant or other persons under

35



VL.

the Program, plus interest and collection costs, in the event the Applicant fails to complete the work
for which the grant was approved or otherwise fails to comply with all applicable Program guidelines
and requirements, ordinances and other laws. 1/We Applicants further acknowledge and agree that, if
funds provided by the City to the Applicant under the Program are determined at any time not to
comply with applicable state laws relating to the authorized uses of such funds, all funds paid to the
Applicant or other persons under the Program shall be immediately returned or reimbursed to the City.

Chapter 2264 Certification: Pursuant to Chapter 2264 of the Texas Local Government Code, I/We
hereby certifies that the Applicant’s business, or a branch, division, or department of the Applicant’s
business, does not and will not knowingly employ an undocumented worker. An undocumented
worker means an individual who, at the time of employment, is not lawfully admitted for permanent

.residence to the United States or authorized under the law to be employed in that manner in the

United States. If after receiving this grant from the City of Whitesboro, Applicant, or a branch, division,
or department of Applicant’s business, is convicted of a violation under 8 U.S.C. Section 1324a(f),
Applicant shall repay the amount of the grant with interest, at the rate and according to the terms
provided by this Agreement under Section 2264.053 of the Texas Local Government Code, not later
than the 120th day after the date the Applicant is notified of the violation. I/We agree that this
document serves as an agreement under Chapter 380 of the Texas Local Government Code.

I/We agree to indemnify, release, defend and hold harmless the City of Whitesboro and its officers,
employees and agents, from and against all claims, losses, liabilities, damages, suits, actions, or
proceedings asserted or brought by any person, including Applicant and the property owner and their
respective officers, employees, agents, contractors, and subcontractors, arising out of personal injury,
death or property damage from any cause whatsoever in whole or in part arising out of this Agreement

or the activities completed hereunder.

Applicant or Authorized Agent of Applicant

Consent of the Owner to the Use and Disclosure of Information

I/We, o M/IJ:L 8‘]‘ , am the

owner of the land ﬂlat the subject of this Application, and I/we authorize and consent to the use by
or the disclosure to any person or public body, including the City of Whiteshoro, of any personal or
other information that is collected for the purposes of processing this application and administering
the grant program. (Note: Information provided in this application will become a public record, subject
to disclosure under the Texas Public Information Act and/or Texas Open Meetings Act.)

A/ (24 J”/éjéﬂf\

Date Sgénature/of Owner(s) )

36



WHITESBOP\,

TEXAS
Downtown Building Improvement Grant Fee Waiver Application

The information requested below will be used to process your application under the terms and conditions of
the City of Whiteshoro’s Downtown Building Improvement Grant.

The Fee Waiver Incentive provides a waiver from City fees for building owners and developers of new
construction, expansion, or renovation in the downtown district.

{If you are also applying for the Downtown Building Improvement Grant, you may skip 1o step V, as this form

will serve as an addendum to that application.)

l. Applicant Information

1, Applicant(s) name: L@Y\C\\U—m /AN Mﬂ;\, g""

Mailing address:  P.0. X (ﬂ%O

City: wl(w(tsﬁ)m . state: ToL zﬁ:: 1273

2. Applicant’s daytime telephone number: ‘10% 4%(# ”%‘% ¥ T
E-mail address: louvebga\llso n ma,h\@%ma,:( LT

3 Status of applicant (please check one)
Property owner with vacant facility
Property owner with tenant business :
z Property owner/operator of existing business on property _
Property deed, lease, or other document evidencing applicant’s status

5, Length of ownership: 64 Wb ~
Date purchased: -

II. Property Information

1. Address of property to be improved: Z% b Mmacn .S':'"f M’WS‘)W)W?@L—ZB

2. Legal description of subject prorerty
{

& -loA2 Rtk a\’\.f\l\ e fe A7, Wdisideds

37



3. Grayson County Tax Assessor Parcel Number(s):
[Tovo |

4, Year built: ]®90" Square footage: 5000 c;.%{l

6. What are the current types of busmesses or other uses occupying the building?

o Re “gmpﬁ

F ! Name and phone number of tenant(s), if applicable: Syt &> (JQM

,&amwﬂub&u%ﬂoﬁ_"bﬂ—los
(Attach additional marmes/nurkbers, if needed)

- 8. Use of building after construction: AL fo- (‘MM

9. Number of parking spaces provided: Proposed: Total:

10.  Current zoning,__ [rryumentcaAy

1L Is a zoning amendment required? Yes_ No_/

Project Description

1: Description of Proposed Improvements. Please provide a detailed description of your
proposed improvements. Attach a copy of your architectural or design plans if possible.

cription: WQW ) d’OM \M Wﬂm
M%@#\ P oﬁ\ E@\g

o
{Designs Attached 1 “Before” Picture(s) Attached
2. How many jobs will be retained once the project is completed?

{_~ Full-time positions ’ZO Part-time positions

38



3. How many new positions will result from this project?

NP&’ Full-time positions NA’ Part-time positions

Work Estimates

Please attach independent contractor estimates for the proposed improvements. Eligible costs shall be
the cost of materials, equipment, and contracted labor to complete eligible improvements.

% Name/company and phone numbey of preferred contractor:
: $27AY
2\4-310. 1446
Amount;__ 25-2Zp
2. Name/company and phone number of second contractor (if obtained):
Drea §

Ve Rtte
Amount: 26,030 .-

3. Additional estimates/comments: (Please attach additional quotes, as required)

4, Total estimated costs of your improvements: 25- %O\(_,,

4. Estimated completion date for your improvements? _ﬂ%ﬂ\-{_ Dacm‘u,{ \e'i 7,07,“("

Agreement of Applicant and Property Owner

- <

I/We, Lﬁ‘i‘”’ﬁ“\o v M , of the
City of Whiteshoro,«éon.lhty of Grayson, State of Texas, declare under penalty of perjury that the
information contained in this application is true and correct and that the information contained in the
documents that accompany this application is true, correct, and complete. |/We certify and warrant
that the proposed work described in this Application meets the eligibility requirements of the City of
Whiteshoro Downtown Building Improvement Grant Program. In exchange for the City of Whitesboro’s
consideration of this application, I/We hereby agree to the following:

I/We hereby authorize City of Whitesboro employees and agents to perform inspections of my/our
property if granted funds under the City of Whitesboro Downtown Building Improvement Grant
Program, both before and during the work for which funds are granted under this Program and after
completion of the work to ensure compliance with the terms and conditions of the Program and all
other applicable ordinances and other laws.

" I/We acknowledge that any work carried out prior to written confirmation of grant approval may not
‘be eligible for reimbursement.

I/We acknowledge receiving, understanding, and accepting the terms and conditions of the City of
Whiteshoro Downtown Building Improvement Grant Program, and agree to fully comply with the same
along with all other applicable ordinances and other laws, all of which are incorporated herein by

39



V1.

reference, if granted funds under the Program. | agree that the City of Whitesboro is entitled to the
immediate return or reimbursement of any and all funds paid to the Applicant or other persons under
the Program, plus interest and collection costs, in the event the Applicant fails to complete the work
for which the grant was approved or otherwise fails to comply with all applicable Program guidelines
and requirements, ordinances and other laws. |/We Applicants further acknowledge and agree that, if
funds provided by the City to the Applicant under the Program are determined at any time not to
comply with applicable state laws relating to the authorized uses of such funds, all funds paid to the
Applicant or other persons under the Program shall be immediately returned or reimbursed to the City.

Chapter 2264 Certification: Pursuant to Chapter 2264 of the Texas Local Government Code, I/We
hereby certifies that the Applicant’s business, or a branch, division, or department of the Applicant’s
business, does not and will not knowingly employ an undocumented worker. An undocumented
worker means an individual who, at the time of employment, is not lawfully-admitted for permanent
residence to the United States or authorized under the law to be employed in that manner in the
United States. If after receiving this grant from the City of Whiteshoro, Applicant, or a branch, division,
or department of Applicant’s business, is convicted of a violation under 8 U.S.C. Section 1324a(f),
Applicant shall repay the amount of the grant with interest, at the rate and according to the terms
provided by this Agreement under Section 2264.053 of the Texas Local Government Code, not later
than the 120th day after the date the Applicant is notified of the violation. I/We agree that this
document serves as an agreement under Chapter 380 of the Texas Local Government Code.

I/We agree to indemnify, release, defend and hold harmless the City of Whitesboro and its officers,
employees and agents, from and against all claims, losses, liabilities, damages, suits, actions, or
proceedings asserted or brought by any person, including Applicant and the property owner and their
respective officers, employees, agents, contractors, and subcontractors, arising out of personal injury,
death or property damage from any cause whatsoever in whole or in part arising out of this Agreement
or the activities completed hereunder.

Sl Fﬁ‘l)fﬂ‘ oA

Applicant or Authorized Agent of Applicant

Consent of the Owner to the Use and Disclosure of Information

I/We, \,3{\8 e \ﬂ\ﬁm gﬂl—. i , am the

owner of the land iﬁat iSthe subject of this Application, and I/we authorize and consent to the use by
or the disclosure to any person or public body, including the City of Whiteshoro, of any personal or
other information that is collected for the purposes of processing this application and administering
the grant program. (Note: Information provided in this application will become a public record, subject
to disclosure under the Texas Public Information Act and/or Texas Open Meetings Act.)

s /ﬁéw«/@

4 9/24

Date

Signature of Owner(s)

40



41



42



V.
. WHITESBORQO

Agenda Background

Agenda Item: Discuss, consider and possible action on ordinance 1220 amending the
preservation board.

Date: April 16, 2024

All changes from my notes of the meeting and provided by Alderman Moore have been made. This
was provided to the City Attorney for review. As of April 10%, I have not heard from the attorney.
If his he has changes I will get those to council prior to the meeting.

43



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WHITESBORO,
TEXAS, AMENDING THE CODE OF WHITESBORO, THE CODE OF
ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF WHITESBORO, TEXAS, BY AMENDING
SUBSECTIONS (B), (C), (D), (E), (F) AND (G) OF SECTION 33.02 OF CHAPTER
33 (DEPARTMENTS, BOARDS, AND COMMISSIONS), RESTRUCTURING THE
WHITESBORO PRESERVATION BOARD TO ESTABLISH SEVEN MEMBERS
TO SERVE FOR STAGGERED TERMS OF TWO YEARS, TO REDEFINE THE
BOARD’S PURPOSES, TO CLARIFY MEMBERSHIP AND RESPONSIBILITIES
OF MEMBERS, AND TO REVISE RULES OF PROCEDURE; PROVIDING A
REPEALING CLAUSE; PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; AND,
PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, the City Council has created the Whitesboro Preservation Board to aid and
assist in the preservation and promotion of buildings of historic and architectural significance; and

WHEREAS, the ordinances pertaining to the Whitesboro Preservation Board have not been
amended or supplemented since adoption in 1996, nearly 30 years; and

WHEREAS, a need exists to restructure Board membership and to redefine the scope and
advisory authority of the Board, which the Council finds and determines to be in the best interests of
the citizens of the City of Whitesboro.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
WHITESBORO, TEXAS:

Section1.  That subsection (B) of Section 33.02 of Chapter 33, Departments, Boards,
and Commissions, of the Code of Whitesboro, the Code of Ordinances of the City of Whitesboro,
Texas, be and is hereby amended by adding new subparts (5) and (6), to further define and
describe the purposes of the Whitesboro Preservation Board, said subparts (5) and (6) to read in
their entirety as follows:

“CHAPTER 33
DEPARTMENTS, BOARDS, AND CONMMISSIONS

§ 33.02 PRESERVATION BOARD

44



mfemat-ten—en—thm—ppegmm—see—hﬂp#wwmﬁexa&qe#

(58) The Board shall be responsible for and shall establish procedures for the
use and rental of the Sullivan property, subject to Council approval, which procedures
shall not discriminate against any person, organization or entity because of race, color,
religion, sex, handicap, familial status, or national origin. The Board shall do and
perform such other acts and duties as it may be called upon to perform by the city
managerfadministrator or the city council.

(67 The Board is purely advisory in nature and shall function in an advisory
capacity to the Council. Nevertheless, the Board may do and perform such
administrative functions as may be delegated by the Council.”

Section 2. That subsection (C) of Section 33.02 of Chapter 33, Departments, Boards,
and Commissions, of the Code of Whitesboro, the Code of Ordinances of the City of Whiteshoro,
Texas, be and is hereby amended by replacing subsection (C) in its entirety and with the following
subsection (C), reorganizing the structure and membership of the Board, such that subsection
(C) of Section 33.02 shall read as follows:

“CHAPTER 33
DEPARTMENTS, BOARDS, AND COMMISSIONS

§ 33.02 PRESERVATION BOARD

(C) Appointment of Board members.

(1) The Board shall consist of seven (7) members appointed by the City Council
with one appointee, in so far as possible, from each of the following five civic
organizations which have expressed interest in the Board: Contemporary
Woman's Club; History Club; Kiwanis Club of Whitesboro; Lien's—Club—of
Whitesbere-and PEO Chapter A. If these organizations are unavailable to furnish
a representative to the Board, the City Council may designate a representative
from a similar interested civic organization or any resident of the city.

(2) At least three (3) twe-{2} members of the Board shall be residents of the City.
The City Administrator, or designee, and a Whitesboro Chamber of Commerce
board member shall be a nonvoting ex officio member.”

Section 3.  That subsection (D) of Section 33.02 of Chapter 33, Departments, Boards,
and Commissions, of the Code of Whiteshoro, the Code of Ordinances of the City of Whiteshoro,
Texas, be and is hereby amended by replacing subsection (D) in its entirety and with the following
subsection (D), setting the terms of office of members of the Board to two (2) year terms of office,
such that subsection (D) of section 33.02 shall read as follows:

45



“GHAPTER 33
DEPARTMENTS, BOARDS, AND COMMISSIONS

§ 33.02 PRESERVATION BOARD

(D) Terms of Board Members. The members of the Board shall serve staggered iwo-
year terms of office, and serve at the pleasure of the Council. Vacancies in office
shall be filled by appointment by the Council for the remainder of the unexpired
term(s} of office.

n

Section 4.  That subsection (E) of Section 33.02 of Chapter 33, Departments, Boards,
and Commissions, of the Code of Whitesboro, the Code of Ordinances of the City of Whitesboro,
Texas, be and is hereby amended by replacing subsection (E} in its entirety and with the following
subsection (E), petaining to the Board’'s selection of its officers, such that subsection (E) of
section 33.02 shall read as follows:

“CHAPTER 33
DEPARTMENTS, BOARDS, AND COMMISSIONS

§ 33.02 PRESERVATION BOARD

(E) Selection of officers. After initial appointments of the Board, and thereafter at
least annually, the Board shall select one of its members to serve as President for
a term of one year. The members shall also select a Vice President {o serve during
the absence of the President. All records of the Board shall be kept and
maintained by the City Secretary in accordance with the City's adopted records
retention schedule,

Section 5,  That subsection (F) of Section 33.02 of Chapter 33, Departments, Boards,
and Commissions, of the Code of Whitésboro, the Code of Ordinances of the City of Whitesharo,
Texas, be and is hereby amended by replacing subsection (F) in its entirety and with the following
subsection {F), pertaining to the Board's financial authority, such that subsection (F) of section
33.02 shall read as follows:

“CHAPTER 33
DEPARTMENTS, BOARDS, AND COMMISSIONS

46



§ 33.02 PRESERVATION BOARD

(F) Financial matters. The Board shall recommend to the Council an annual budget for
restoration, improvements and maintenance of the Sullivan Property and other city owned
historical sites in the City. The Board’s proposed budget shall be presented to the Council
for consideration and approval as part of the City's annual budget. The Board shall also
have authority to seek gifts, donations and grants to the City for the purpose of acquiring,
restoring, maintaining and operating such buildings or other properties as the Board may
identify as being of historic, economic, cultural or social importance to the City. Any such
funds or services actually received by the City shall be designated as restricted funds to
be used only for the purposes provided in this section.

n

Section 6.  That subsection (G) of Section 33.02 of Chapter 33, Departments, Boards,
and Commissions, of the Code of Whitesboro, the Code of Ordinances of the City of Whitesboro,
Texas, be and is hereby amended by replacing subsection (G) in its entirety and with the following
subsection (G), pertaining to the Board’s meetings and rules of procedure, such that subsection
(G) of section 33.02 shall read as follows:

“CHAPTER 33
DEPARTMENTS, BOARDS, AND COMMISSIONS

§ 33.02 PRESERVATION BOARD

(G) Meetings and rules of procedure of Board. The Board shall meet at least quarterly
or more often as necessary in order to satisfy the purposes of this section. The President
shall preside at all meetings of the Board, and in the absence of the President, the Vice-
President shall preside. The Board shall adopt such rules of procedure as are consistent
with the orderly conduct of business. All meetings of the Board shall be conducted in
compliance with the Texas Open Meetings Act, as amended.

Section 7.  That the City Council of the City of Whitesboro, as soon as practical from
and after the effective date of this Ordinance, shall select new members to serve as regular, voting
members of the Whitesboro Preservation Board. Four members shall serve initial terms of two (2)
years, and three (3) shall serve initial terms of one (1) year. Subsequent appointments to the one-
year members’ places shall be for terms of two (2) years.

47



Section 8. That all provisions of the Code of Whitesboro, Texas, in conflict with the
provisions of this ordinance be, and the same are hereby, repealed, and all other provisions not
in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance shall remain in full force and effect.

Section 9.  That it is the intention of the city council of the City of Whitesboro that if any
phrase, sentence, section, or paragraph of this ordinance shall be declared unconstitutional or
otherwise invalid by final judgment of a court of competent jurisdiction, such unconstitutionality or
invalidity shall not affect any of the remainder of this ordinance since the same would have been
enacted by the City Council without the incorporation of the unconstitutional or invalid phrase,
senfence, section, or paragraph,

Section 10. That this ordinance shall take effect immediately from and after its passage
and the publication of the caption, as the law and charter in such cases provide.

Passed and Approved this day of , 2024,

David Blaylock, Mayor
ATTEST:

Teresa Nifio, City Secretary

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

David Berman, City Attorney

48



X WHITESBORQ

Agenda Background

Agenda Item: Discuss, consider and possible action on an ordinance for the adoption of
the International Property Maintenance Code.

Date: April 16, 2024

This ordinance was introduced at the last council meeting. Council requested some changes. The

city attorney over this ordinance has made those changes and is ready to bring this back before

council.

49



ORDINANCE NO. 1222

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF WHITESBORO, TEXAS,
AMENDING TITLE XV, LAND USUAGE, CHAPTER 150 BUILDING
REGULATIONS TO DELETE DUPLICATE PROVISIONS,
REORGANIZE PROVISIONS RELATED TO DANGEROUS AND
SUBSTANDARD BUILDINGS, AND ADOPT THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE WITH AMENDMENTS;
PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF ALL ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT;
PROVIDING A SAVINGS CLAUSE; PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY
CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR A PENALTY OF FINE NOT TO EXCEED
THE SUM OF TWO THOUSAND DOLLARS ($2,000.00) FOR EACH
OFFENSE; AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, the International Code Council (ICC) has developed a set of comprehensive
and coordinated international model construction codes (known generally as the "International
Codes"); and

WHEREAS, the International Codes have been reviewed by the City staff and found to be
a comprehensive code setting minimum property maintenance standards that are designed to
protect the health, safety and welfare or the citizens of the City of Whitesboro; and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Whitesboro has determined that it is in the
best interest of the citizens of the City of Whitesboro to adopt the 2018 editions of the International
Property Maintenance Code, as stated herein, as the minimum standards for the construction, use,
occupancy and maintenance of buildings and structures within the City limits, as set forth herein,
and to adopt local amendments to said codes in order to account for unique local practices and/or
conditions relating to the design and construction of structures within the City;

NOW THEREFORLE, BE I'T ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY
OF WHITESBORO, TEXAS:

SECTION 1. The Code of Ordinances of the City of Whitesboro is hereby amended to
delete Section 150.006 “International Residential Code, edition 2018 adopted” of Title XV, “Land
Usage,” Chapter 150 “Building Regulations”, in its entivety and reserve save section for later
replacement.

SECTION 2. The Code of Ordinances of the City of Whitesboro is hereby amended as
follows to reorganize provisions related to dangerous and substandard buildings and adopt the
International Property Maintenance Code, 2018 edition. at Title XV, “Land Usage,” Chapter 150
“Building Regulations, ” by amending sections 3.04.001 and 3.04.002 thereof to read in their
entirety as follows:

“CHAPTER 150 BUILDING REGULATIONS

»
.

50



DANGEROUS AND SUBSTANDARD BUILDINGS, PROPERTY MAINTENANCE
CODE

§ 150.060 PURPOSE.

This article is adopted pursuant to the Texas Local Government Code, Chapter 54 and Chapter
214 to establish minimum standards:

1. For the continued use and occupancy of all types of buildings and structures within
the city, regardless of the date of their construction:

2. To safeguard the public health, safety and welfare;

3. To protect property; and

4. To provide the authority to address, and direct the method of addressing unsafe

buildings and structures within the city.

§150.061. ENFORCEMENT AND PENALTY PROVISIONS

(A) Any person who violates any provision of this chapter shall, upon conviction, be
punished pursuant to section §10.99.

(B.) The building official and his inspectors and assistants shall have the right to
enforce the provisions of this chapter and the right to inspect and enter upon all premises
and buildings or structures within the city to make such inspections as are necessary for
the protection of the property and surrounding property and the public as a whole.

Ordinance No.

51



§150.062. MINIMUM BUILDING STANDARDS CODE ADOPTED

(A) In addition to the International Building Code, National Electric Code, International
Residential Code, International Plumbing Code, International Mechanical Code, and
International Energy Conservation Code adopted in this Title, and the International Fire
Code adopted in Chapter 92, the 2018 International Property Maintenance Code is hereby
adopted as the Minimum Building Standard Code of the City of Whitesboro.

(B.) Where a provision of the International Building Code, National Electric Code,
International Residential Code, International Plumbing Code, International Mechanical
Code, and International Energy Conservation Code adopted in this Title, and the
International Fire Code, or the 2018 International Property Maintenance Code conflict with
a section of this article, the language contained in a section of this article governs.

Ordinance No. Page 3

52



Ordinance No.

53

Page 4



8§150.063. Exceptions, amendments, and deletions to the International Property

Maintenance Code, 2018 Edition.
(A) IPMC Section 103.5 Fees shall be deleted in its entirety.
(B.) IPMC Section 111.1 Application for appeal, shall read:

Anv person directly affected by a decision of the code official or a notice or order issued under
this code shall have the right to appeal to the Building Standards Commission, provided that a
written application for appeal is filed within 20 days after the day the decision, notice or order was
served. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of this code or the
rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do
not fully apply, or the requirements of this code are adequately satisfied by other means, or that
the strict application of this code would cause an undue hardship.

(CJ IPMC Sections 111.2—111.8 shall be deleted.
D) IPMC Section 106.3 Prosecution of violation, shall read:

Any person failing to comply with the provisions of this code shall be deemed guilty of a
misdemeanor or civil infraction as determined by the local municipality, and the violation shall be
deemed a strict liability offense. The code official shall institute the appropriate proceeding at law
or in equity to restrain, correct or abate such violation. Any action taken by the authority having
jurisdiction on such premises shall be charged against the real estate upon which the structure is
located and shall be a lien upon such estate.

(E) IPMC Section 112.4 Failure to comply shall be amended to read:
#
Ordinance No. Page 5

o4



Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work order, except
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, is subject
to a fine of not less than one dollar ($1.00) and no more than two thousand dollars ($2,000.00),
and each day work continues in violation of this section shall be a separate offense.

(F)IPMC Section 108.2 Closing of Vacant Structures, shall read:

If the structure is vacant and unfit for human habitation and occupancy, and is not in danger of
structural collapse, the code official is authorized to have the structure closed. Upon the structure
being closed, the code official will send a bill to the owner for the cost of the closure and inform
the property owner of their right to appeal the closure of the structure to the Building Standards
Commission pursuant to Chapter 150, Article V, Section 150.066 of the City of Whitesboro Code
of Ordinances. The code official shall cause the premises to be closed and secured through any
available public agency or by contract or arrangement by private persons and the closure shall be
charged against the real estate upon which the structure is located and shall be a lien upon such
real estate and may be collected by any other legal resource.

(G) IPMC Section 107.2 Form, shall read:

Be in writing,

Include a description of the real estate sufficient for identification.

[O'S T | N

Include a statement of the violation or violations and why the notice is being issued.

E-N

: Include a correction order allowing time to make the repairs and improvements required to
bring the dwelling unit or structure into compliance with the provisions of this code.

5. Inform the property owner or owner’s authorized agent of the right to appeal.
6. Include a statement of the right to file a lien in accordance with Section 106.3.
(H.) IPMC Section 108.4.1 Placarding, shall read:

The code official shall post on the premises or on defective equipment a placard and a statement
of the penalties provided for occupying the premises, operating the equipment or removing the
placard.

(I.) IPMC Section 109.4 Emergency repairs shall be deleted.
(J.) IPMC Section 109.5 Costs of emergency repairs shall be deleted.
(K.) IPMC Section 110.1 General shall be amended to read:

The code official shall order the owner or owner's authorized agent of any premises upon which is
located any structure that is so old, dilapidated or has become so out of repair as to be dangerous,
unsafe, unsanitary or otherwise unfit for human habitation and occupancy. such that it is
unreasonable to repair the structure, to demolish and remove such structure; to include but not be
limited to, the removal of the concrete foundations and their components, porches, steps,
walkways. and curbs. Lot must be left in a raked clean condition and must not pond water. The
site must be graded to a smooth uniform condition that will provide adequate surface drainage
without ponding.

(L) IPMC Section 302.4 Weeds shall be deleted.
M) IPMC Section 302.8 Motor vehicle shall be deleted.

Ordinance No. Page 6

55



M) IPMC Section 302.9 Defacement of property shall be deleted.
0) IPMC Section 303.2 Enclosures shall be amended to read:

Private swimming pools, hot tubs and spas, containing water more than 24 inches (610 mm) in
depth shall be completely surrounded by a fence or barrier at 72 inches (1830 mm) in height above
the finished ground level measured on the side of the barrier away from the pool. The remainder
of the section is unchanged.

Exception: When the yard in which the private swimming pool, hot tub, and spa is constructed is
completely enclosed with an approved fence or barrier.

(P.)IPMC Section 304.3 Premises Identification, shall read:

Buildings shall have approved address numbers placed in a position to be plainly legible and
visible from the street or road fronting the property. These numbers shall contrast with their
backeround. Address numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabet letters. Numbers shall be a
minimum of 4 inches high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch (12.7mm). The numbers shall
be on the building or a structure facing the main Right-of-Way. The curbs are not an acceptable
location for addresses for 911 purposes.

Q) IPMC Section 304.5.1 Ventilation shall be added and shall read:

Crawl space under buildings without basements shall be ventilated by approved mechanical means

or by openings in foundation walls. The minimum net area of ventilation openings shall not be less

than 1 sq. ft. for each 150 sq. ft. of crawl space area. Ventilation openings shall be covered for
their height and width with any of the following materials, provided that the least dimension of the

covering shall not exceed 1/4 inch (6mm):
Perforated sheet metal plates not less than .070" (1.8mm) thick.

Expanded sheet metal plates not less than .047" (1.2mm) thick.

Cast iron grills or gratings.

Extruded load bearing vents.

Hardware cloth of .035" (.89 mm) wire or heavier.

AU S R

Corrosion resistant wire mesh, with the least dimension not exceeding 1/8" (3.2mm).
(R IPMC Section 304.7.1 Ventilation shall be added and shall read:

For gabled and hipped roofs, ventilation shall be provided to furnish cross ventilation of each
separate attic space with weather protected vents. All vents shall be screened to protect the interior

from intrusion of birds. The ratio of total net free ventilating area to the area of the ceiling shall be
not less than 1/150. That ratio may be reduced to 1/300 provided:

1. A vapor barrier having permeance not exceeding one perm is installed on the warm
side of the ceiling, or

2. At least 50% and not more than 80% of the required ventilating area is provided by
ventilators located in the upper portion of the space to be ventilated (at least 3 ft.
(914mm) above eave or cornice vents) with the balance of the required ventilation
provided by eave or cornice vents.

e e s e S e ey e s srwess e e e T e e e DS RS e e e e e > e |
I ——eeer™ ™ ™=

Ordinance No. Page 7

56



For flat roofs, blocking and bridging shall be arranged so as not to interfere with the movement of
air. Such roofs shall be ventilated along the overhanging eaves, with the net area of opening being
not less than 1/150 of the area of the ceiling below.

All openings shall be covered with screening, hardware cloth or equivalent to prevent the entry of
birds, squirrels, rodents, etc. The openings therein shall not exceed 1/4 inch (6.4mm).

(S.)IPMC Section 304.14 Insect Screens, shall read:

Every door, window, and other outside opening of habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food
service areas, or any areas where products to be included or utilized in food for human

consumption are processed, manufactured, packaged or stored, shall be supplied with approved

tightly fitting screens of not less than 16 mesh per inch (16 mesh per 25 mm) and every swinging

door shall have a self-closing device in good working condition.

Exception: Screens on exterior doors and windows shall not be required where a central air
conditioning system is provided.

(T.) IPMC 308.2.2 Refrigerators shall be deleted.
(OB IPMC 308.3.1 Garbage facilities shall be deleted.
V) IPMC 403.2 Bathrooms and toilet rooms shall be amended to read:

Every bathroom and toilet room shall comply with the ventilation requirements for habitable
spaces as required in section 403.1, except that a window shall not be required in such spaces
equipped by a mechanical ventilation system.

(W) IPMC Section 602.3 Heat Supply, shall read:

Every owner and operator of any building who rents, leases or lets one or more dwelling unit,
rooming unit, dormitory or guestroom on terms, either expressed or implied, to furnish heat to the

occupants thereof shall supply heat to maintain a temperature of not less than 68F in all habitable
rooms, bathrooms, and toilet rooms.

IPMC Section 602.4 Occupiable work spaces, shall read:

Indoor occupiable work spaces shall be supplied with heat to maintain a temperature of not less

than 65°F (18°C) during the period the spaces are occupied.

Exceptions:

1. Processing, storage and operation areas that require cooling or special temperature
conditions.

2. Areas in which persons are primarily engaged in vigorous physical activities.

Ordinance No. : Page 8

57



Ordinance No. Page 9

58



Page 10

Ordinance No.

59




oo = - e s o eoaeE T S e A T e e e e e S D e e e |

Ordinance No. Page 11

60



§150.064 UNSAFE BUILDINGS.

All unsafe buildings or structures are hereby declared to be a nuisance and illegal and shall
be abated by securing, repair, removal, or demolition in accordance with the procedures set
forth in this code. As an alternative, the building official, or other employee or official of
this jurisdiction as designated by the governing body, may institute any other appropriate
action to prevent, restrain, correct or abate the violation. -
(A) All buildings or structures which are unsafe, unsanitary, unfit for human
habitation, not provided with adequate egress, or which constitute a fire hazard,

Ordinance No. Page 12

61



otherwise dangerous to human life or which constitute a hazard to the safety, health
or welfare of the public, by reason of inadequate maintenance, dilapidation,

obsolescence, or abandonment, are considered unsafe buildings. :

B.) All buildings regardless of its structural condition, which are unoccupied by
its owners, lessees, or other invitees and are unsecured or inadequately secured from
unauthorized entry to the extent that it could be entered or used by uninvited persons
as a place of harborage or could be entered or used by children or otherwise
constitute a danger to the public are considered unsafe buildings.

§150.065 MIMIMUM BUILDING STADARDS ADOPTED.

Any building or structure whose condition has deteriorated or is operated or maintained in"
violation of the minimum standards for the continued use and occupancy of all types of
buildings and structures within the city, as adopted and established in this chapter, is hereby
subject to investigation by the building official or designated employee in accordance with

Article 18.05 of the Texas Code of Criminal Procedure and may be deemed to be
substandard and a hazard to the public health, safety and/or welfare by the building official

e e ——

Ordinance No. Page 13

62



or employee thereof, building standards commission, municipal court or District Court of
Grayson County, Texas.

§150.066 BUILDING AND STANDARDS COMMISSION

Ordinance No. Page 14

63



(A) Appointment. The Building Standards Commission is hereby created and
shall consist of the five members and two alternates as follows:
(1) One member shall be a general contractor;
(2) One member shall be a licensed electrician;
(3) One member shall be a licensed plumber;
(4) Two members and the alternates shall be residents or ad valorem tax payers
of the City of Whitesboro, Texas.

B.) Appointments to the Building Standards Commission shall be for a term of
two years or until replacements are appointed and qualified.

(C:) Functions, Powers, and Duties. The Building and Standards Commission
may:

(1) Order the repair, within a fixed period, of buildings found to be in
violation of an ordinance;

(2) Declare a building substandard in accordance with the powers granted
by this article;

(3) Order, in an appropriate case, the immediate removal of persons or
property found on private property, enter on private property to secure
the removal if it is determined that conditions exist on the property that
constitute a violation of an ordinance, and order action to be taken as
necessary to remedy, alleviate, or remove any substandard building

found to exist;
(4) Issue orders or directives to any peace officer of the state, including a

sheriff or constable or the chief of police of the municipality, to enforce
and carry out the lawful orders or directives of the commission panel;
(5) Determine the amount and duration of the civil penalty the city may
recover;
(6) Exercise all powers and duties as authorized by the Texas Local
Government Code, Chapter 54, Subchapter C, as amended.

Ordinance No. Page 15

64



Page 16

Ordinance No.

65



§150.067 ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT OF MINIMUM

BUILDING STANDARDS
(A) Notice of Violation.

(1) Whenever it is determined that there are reasonable grounds to believe that
there has been a violation of any provision of this article or of any rule or
regulation adopted pursuant thereto, notice of such alleged violation shall be
given to the owner, lienholder, or mortgagee and such alleged violations

shall constitute a nuisance.
(2) The notice shall contain:
i. The date, time, and location of the hearing before the building
standards commission; and
ii. A statement that the owner, lienholder, or mortgagee will be required

to submit proof, at the hearing, of any work that may be required to
comply with the ordinance and the time it will take to reasonably
perform the work.

iii. Prior to conducting the hearing before the Building and Standards
Commission, the city will make an effort to locate each lienholder
and mortgagee having an interest in the building or in the propeity
on which the building is located and give them a notice of and an
opportunity to comment at the hearing.

iv. The city may file notice of the hearing in the official public records

of real property in Grayson County.
B) Building and Standards Commission Hearing.
(1) The Building and Standards Commission will require the owner, lienholder,
or mortgagee of the building to within 30 days:
i. secure the building from unauthorized entry, and
ii. to repair, remove, or demolish the building, whichever is applicable,

unless the owner or lienholder establishes at the hearing that the work

cannot reasonably be performed within 30 days. The city will furnish
a copy of the order to any lienholders or mortgagees in the event the
owner fails to timely take the ordered action.

(2) The Building and Standards Commission may allow the owner, lienholder,
or mortgagee more than 30 days to repair, remove or demolish the building.
However, if the Building and Standards Commission allows the owner,
lienholder, or mortgagee more than 30 days to repair, remove or demolish
the building, the Building and Standards Commission shall establish specific

e ———

Ordinance No. Page 17

66



time schedules, as determined by the Building and Standards Commission,
in_consultation with the city building official or his designee, for the
commencement and performance of the work and shall require the owner,
lienholder, or mortgagee to secure the property in a reasonable manner from
unauthorized entry while the work is being performed. The city will furnish
a copy of the order to any lienholders or mortgagees in the event the owner
fails to timely take the ordered action.

(3) The Building and Standards Commission may not allow the owner,
lienholder, or mortgagee more than 90 days to repair, remove, or demolish
the building or to fully perform all work required to comply with the order
unless at the hearing the owner, lienholder, or mortgagee submits:

i. adetailed plan and time schedule for the work, and
ii. establishes that the work cannot reasonably be completed within 90
days because of the scope and complexity of the work.

(4) If the Building and Standards Commission allows the owner, lienholder, or
mortgagee more than 90 days to complete any part of the work required to
repair, remove, or demolish the building, the Building and Standards
commission shall require the owner, lienholder, or mortgagee to regularly
submit progress reports to the city building official to demonstrate that the
owner, lienholder, or mortgagee has complied with the time schedules
established for commencement and performance of the work. The city will
furnish a copy of the order to any lienholders or mortgagees in the event the
owner fails to timely take the ordered action.

(5) Burden of Proof. In the hearing to determine whether a building complies
with the standards set out in the minimum building standards code, the
owner, lienholder, or mortgagee has the burden of proof to demonstrate the
scope of any work that may be required to comply with the minimum
building standards code and the time it will take to reasonably perform the

work.
(C) Procedure After Building and Standards Commission Hearing. After the

hearing before the Building and Standards Commission the city shall deliver a copy

of the order by personal delivery or by certified mail, return receipt requested, to the
record owners of the affected property and to any lienholder or mortgagee of the
affected property. Within ten days after the date the order from the Building and
Standards Commission is issued the city will:
(1) File a copy of the order in the office of the city secretary; and
(2) Publish in the city's official newspaper a notice containing:
i. The street address or legal description of the property:
ii. The date of the hearing;

Ordinance No. Page 18

67



iii. A brief statement indicating the results of the hearing or order; and

iv. Instructions stating where a complete copy of the order may be
obtained.
(D) Enforcement.

(1) After the expiration of the time granted by the Building and Standards
Commission for the repair, removal, securing, demolition of a building, or
the relocation of occupants of a building, whichever is applicable, the city
will either:

i. Refer the building to municipal court for criminal prosecution; or
ii. Vacate, secure, remove, or demolish the building, or relocate the

occupants, whichever is applicable, and assess the expenses against
the property on which the building is located unless it is homestead
property protected by the Texas Constitution; or

iii. Repair the building and assess the expenses on the land on which the

building stands or to which it is attached; or
iv. Assess a civil penalty against the property owner for failure to repair,
remove, or demolish the building.

(2) The city will not repair residential buildings with 11 or more dwelling units.
(3) The Building and Standards Commission by order, may assess and recover

a civil penalty against the property owner in an amount not to exceed
$1.000.00 per day for each violation or, if the owner shows that the property
is the owner's lawful homestead, in an amount not to exceed $10.00 per day
for each violation, if the city proves:
i. The property owner was notified of the requirements of this article;
and
ii. After notification, the property owner committed an act in violation

of this article or failed to take an action necessary for compliance
with this article.

(4) Effect of Notice to Mortgagee and Lienholders. If the notice is given and
the opportunity to relocate the tenants of the building or to repair, remove,
or demolish the building is afforded to each mortgagee and lienholder as
authorized in this Article, the lien is a privileged lien subordinate only to tax

liens.
(E) Notice and Right to Secure Substandard Structures.
(1) The city may secure a building the city determines violates the minimum
standards set forth in the minimum building standards code and is

unoccupied or is occupied only by persons who do not have a right of

possession to the building.

Er———s——osr - ws_aeoe-e e s s s S e e s ey, e e e s

Ordinance No. Page 19

68



(2) Before the eleventh day after the date the building is secured, the city will
give notice to the owner of the building by either:
i. Personally serving the owner with written notice; or
ii. Depositing the notice in the United States mail addressed to the
owner at the owner's post office address; or
iii. If personal service cannot be obtained and the owner's post office
address is unknown:
a. Publishing the notice at least twice within a ten-day period in
the official newspaper of the city; or
b. Posting the notice on or near the front door of the building.
(3) The notice will contain:
i. An identification of the building and the property on which it is
located; and

ii. A description of the violation of the minimum building standards
code standards that is present at the building; and

iii. A statement that the city will secure or has secured, as the case may
be, the building; and

iv. The owner's right to request a hearing about any matter relating to the
city's securing of the building.

(4) If, within 30 days after the date the city secures a building secured as
provided in this sub-section, the owner files with the city a written request
for a hearing, the Building and Standards Commission will conduct a hearing
at which the owner may testify or present witnesses or written information
about any matter relating to the city's securing of the building.

(5) The building standards commission will conduct the hearing within 20 days
after the date the request is filed.

(6) After the hearing relating to the city’s securing of the building, or the
expiration of the time allowed for the owner to request a hearing and no
hearing has been requested, the city will mail by certified mail, return receipt
requested, a copy of the order to the owner of the building and to any
lienholder or mortgagee of the building. Within ten days after the date the
order from the Building and Standards Commission is issued the city will:

i. File a copy of the order in the office of the city secretary: and
ii. Publish in the city's official newspaper a notice containing;
iii. The street address or legal description of the property;
iv. The date of the hearing;

v. A brief statement indicating the results of the hearing or order; and
vi. Instructions stating where a complete copy of the order may be
obtained.

Ordinance No. Page 20

69



(7) The city may assess the expenses incurred to secure a building pursuant to
this sub-section against the property on which the building is located unless

it is homestead property protected by the Texas Constitution.

(8) Demolition regulations extended to cover site clearance, leveling, and
grading. In addition to the building regulations contained in this article, the
regulations concerning the demolition of buildings and permits therefore are
extended to cover and include the grading and leveling and clearance of the
site of the demolition where the removal of structures makes such grading,

leveling or clearance necessary, or where such grading, leveling or clearance
is necessary to protect adjacent property for the public safety.

§150.068-.079 RESERVED

Ordinance No. Page 21

70



Page 22

Ordinance No.

71



Page 23

Ordinance No.

12



SECTION 3. All provisions of the Ordinances of the City of Whitesboro, Texas, in conflict with
the provisions of this Ordinance be, and the same are hereby amended and repealed, and all other
provisions of the Ordinances of the City not in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance shall
remain in full force and effect.

SECTION 4. If any article, paragraph or subdivision, clause or provision of this Ordinance shall
be judged invalid or held unconstitutional, the same shall not affect the validity of this Ordinance
as a whole or any part or provision thereof, other than the part so decided to be valid or
unconstitutional.

SECTION 5. An offense committed before the effective date of this Ordinance is governed by
prior law and the provisions of the Ordinances of the City of Whitesboro, as amended, in effect
when the offense was committed and the former law is continued in effect for this purpose

SECTION 6. Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions or terms of this
Ordinance shall be subject to the same penalty as provided for in the Code of Ordinances, as
amended, and upon conviction in the municipal court shall be punished by a fine not to exceed the
sum of Two Thousand Dollars ($2,000.00) for each offense, and each and every day such violation
shall continue shall be deemed to constitute a separate offense.

SECTION 7. This ordinance shall take effect immediately from and after the publication of its
caption, as the law in such cases provides.

DULY PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
WHITESBORO, TEXAS ON THIS THE DAY OF APRIL, 2024.

APPROVED:

David Blaylock, Mayor

ATTEST:

Ordinance No. ' Page 24

73



Teresa Nino, City Secretary

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Courtney Goodman-Morris, City Attorney
4880-0016-9392, v. 1

Ordinance No. Page 25

74



I WHITESBORQ

Agenda Background

Agenda Item: Discuss, consider and possible action on the contract for the purchase of
land.

Date: April 16,2024

The City Aftorney is still working out some of the finer details. I expect to have the contract
complete later this week. When the final comes in, I will provide it to you. If we do not receive it
before the meeting we will table this item.

15



¥ WHITESBORQ

r:r: By

L " (s
b b\
i G A0 £ D

Agenda Background

Agenda Item: Discuss and consider updates on the on-going capital improvement
projects.

Date: April 16, 2024

I have no real updates.

T met with a representative with Billy Wolf. We are still in discussions. We were able to present to
him the survey from Kelly St.

We are still accepting bids for the Texoma Rehabilitation project.

76



